fearae uwr Ry 9w gfRkEc™

fadidp, 1 fRyawR, 2025

= faoHo—fEma—fags / 1— 131/2025—1%maa <9 faeme |9 & ufshar vd wrd
dared  frErEel, 1973 & FRIR—140 @ S=Ia fRATAd U GETICl IoT (e faers,
2025 (2025 &1 ferId A=gid 19) ST oMWt faiid 1 RIawR, 2025 &7 fRvrae y<wr faum= a+m #
RINUT BT bl &, FIATEIRYT DI Fare o197 H Jfad H g N fbar S & |

FXATEIRT / —
gfera,
feogo faum T |

2025 BT faergd dAw=aih 19.

fRwTere uewr el <eT (Gene) faRrre, 2025
HUSl BT HH

Hfereg = |

&RT 2 BT FINA |
ORT 4 BT TN |
&RT 5 BT TN |
RT 5—F BT HINE |
¢RT 7—a DT G |
&RT 9 T FIMA |
&RT 31 BT FINE |
9. ©RT 32 BT G |
10. ©IRT 33 BT A |
11. ©RT 38 BT A |
12. €RT 39 BT A |
13. ©RT 40 BT AT |
14. SRT 41 BT A |
15. €IRT 60 T HATY |
16. ©IRT 64 T HAT |
17. RT 76 BT A |
18. SIRT 99 BT AT |
19. YRT 115 BT YfRRATIA |
20. ©RT 120 BT HATE |
21. ORT 121 T BT XA |
22, ORT 122 BT AU |
23, ORT 133 BT A |
24. ORT 134 BT AT |
25. ORT 142 BT A |

© N ok~



26. URT 144 BT A |
27. ORT 145 BT A |
28. YRT 151 BT Gfa=emu |
29. YRT 152 BT HMEH |
30. €IRT 155 T G |
31. YRT 158—¢ BT T |
32. €RT 160 BT G |
33. YRT 160—& BT G |
34. YRT 161 BT FA |
35. YRT 167 BT T |
36. €IRT 169 BT G |
37. ©RT 172 BT G |
38. YRT 186 BT T |
39. YRT 190 BT T |
40. IIRIE—3 DT YUY |

fRuTere uewr el Jo7 (Seie) faRrre, 2025
(ferm &+ H qRevenfud w9 #)

feATerel UQel UamIl o7 AR, 1994 (1994 HT IAFTH GRS 4) BT AR FIEH
@ oy g |

TRT TR & Ogakd 9§ # Rared uew faum w9 grr f=faRad w9 & I8
Ffafafag gn—

1. e TM——sa ffam @ dfea W Remed uew g o ([RieE)
arfarfE, 2025 2|

2. URT 2 BT GIEH—RAT™A U garga) ol fdfeE, 1994 (R sod oo
TR el AIH" DET AT & ) Bl &R 2 H—

(@) wWos (22) #, “gvs ufshar AfdT, 1973 @1 ORI 2 W], forgl 3R ol & IH W)
"HRAR ARTRS el Hf2dl, 2023 (2023 HT 46) B ORI 2" e, g 3R 3id
ST |

(@) wWus (35) H, "R gvs Wf2dT, 1860 HI &IRT 21" eal, forvel 3R &fdl & WM W)
IR ~JTg GfRdT, 2023 (2023 &7 45) & €RT 2 (28) ¥Teg, forg @R & g ST |

3. oRT 4 & HAMEE—T ARTRH 1 ORT 4, B IU-RT 3) & Uz AfeRad
TR b SITQ, Srerfe—

“(4) afe PIg Al —
(@) fooh frrafaes maraeh @1 dam, gaderor a1 gfe; a0



(@) fo=ft vfafe @ fo=ft fMatae AmmEen & affafed a1 S+ mafisia fev o= &
T,

forRad wu & ®is HU= a1 WA TN HRar & o fHear 2 iR e fAear gm
BT T A1 S I 2 7 favad & a1 s 9 89 &1 S favary 81 8, ol
g8 GRT 155 & ITAR &0 fbar ST |” |

4.  URT 5 BT HAEE.—T M B aRT 5 H—
(®) IU—9RT (1) H—
() focrr wege §—
(31) "SURGF” T & YA ‘AT e’ TR fqwRfUd fby e, &R
(@M ‘T Teg IR fARY 98¢ TRl & WM WA’ e SR faey

doh” IS hHI T SITTI:

(i) T P A, AN Tew B I R AR U] IGT ST
(@) SU-aRT (3) H—
(i) "ORIROT e & ggETq AT IR wre erdenfud fhy SITe; &R

(i) =ged & o H " o & wWH R v e @ S iR aceEnq
ferferRaa sid:zenfud faar S, reriq——

IR I8 SR b T AR & SIRTwGal & A 9 3R fEAT off
feae @& wARE ge W A faery dea Mo & 3mra | verfird €l @
ST | |

5. ORI 5@ & AIMF.—Ad ARAFTH & gRT 5— & SU-—oRT (1) # "8 7 B
3H R TG d WM W "BRaN] b Ugal IfdaR BI° eq T ST |

6. ORI 7—% BT WURM—Ad MA@ a7 7—& & Iu—orT @) ¥, " g &
W W 7 g X@T S SR deqeEr efeiRad srRenfUa fhan S, srerid—

IR I U BT YL SU—UTH T P d3bi H IRy N & wy A
TEET fhaT SO T gum= Sad §8d | 91T of FhIT|” |

7. O9RT 9 & GIM—d ARAFTH @ gRT 9 @ SU-oRT (1) H |G Brl
3R" wral BT g foar SIreeT |

8. HRT 31 & WUH— AMRAFTTH & 9T 31 B SU—RT (1) ¥, “gvs ufthar |f,
1973 &, g 3R el & WM W "RAR ARTRS GReTl |idl, 2023" (2023 FT 46) s, U=
IR b I ST |

9. ORI 32 HT HMEH.—T JRIH & gRT 32 B IU-GRT (2) H—



() "<vs Ufhar Wfed, 1973 H1 GRT 125" § Wel, &g SR 3Pl & W W 4R
ANTR FReT AlEdl, 2023 (2023 BT 46) DI URT 144" ¥ex, s 3R 3P I ST,
3R

(@) “org A TW" TR B WM WR TP FOIR SUI" Weq /Y A |

10. €T 33 BT HYMEH—A SMAFTA & gRT 33 H, T Al 39 9 ARG IRl &
WM TR U g9IR YUY ddh” Ieg /Y SITUT |
11. R 38 BT FIEA.—T AT BT gRT 38 H——

(@) WU (@) H "R TS Afedl, 1860 P &RT 379" i, forg @R 3fdi B
M R YR <™ A@dl, 2023 (2023 6T 46) I GRT 303 (2)" ¥1eg,
fog, ®Bred SR 3fd W e, 3R

@) wUs (1) ¥ "gue ufhar AfRdT, 1973 B ORT 109 AT 110" ¥&l, g iR
3Pl B WM R IRAT ARTRS T Aigdl, 2023 (2023 BT 46) Bl GRT
128 AT 129" ¥Ie], g 3R 3fd W G |

12. oRT 39 & GIA.— ARFRH & o”71 39 # "< A IR TR B W W

Uh BOR DU e X SITGH |

13. GRT 40 BT HAEH—A AT & g1 40 H, 3o Ufhan WGfdr, 1973 & aRT
202" ¥R, g iR el & M W WRA ANTRS YR AR, 2023 (2023 BT 46) B &R
225" 9Teq, forg @R &fd & SIeT |

14. ORT 41 BT HIFA— JRAFTIH B gRT 41 H—

(@) ST—9RT (1) #, "3l IR TIY" VG| & WM W T §OIR I e /g TG

3R

(@) SI—RT (2) H, UM EOIR ST TGl & W[ W "I FoR S0d" Ieq I TG |

15. ORT 60 HT HIM.—Tc JIRAFTH B aRT 60 B SU-—URT (4) # “RA ARY
i, 1872 Tve ufthar wfear, 1973" vIeel, forrg iR &fdi & wIF WR "R ey srfafa,
2023 (2023 P 47) 9RAI ANTRE JR&AT AfZQT, 2023 (2023 HT 46) veq, g 3R 3id W
ST |

16. SIRT 64 BT HIMMA.—e AT o 9T 64 H,

(@) SU-4RT (2) #, "gve Ufhar dfedr, 1973 & ORT 7" ), g @R il & WM W)
AR ANTRS GRET WiEdT, 2023 Bl &R 7° ¥es, &g 3R 3P I M9; 3R

(@) SU—aRT (5) H, "gvs Ufhar Afedl, 1973 & A 33" ¥<l, fog 3R 3fd & I+
R IR ANTRS GReTT |iZdl, 2023 (2023 &1 46) & AT 34" ¥eq, g 3R i
W SO |

17. ORT 76 &1 GITT— AMRTRA & gRT 76 ¥, "IRATI TUs AiZdl, 1860 HI GRT
75 IT €U Ufshar Wfadl, 1973 &1 RT 356 AT 360 ¥eal, faal 3R 3Pl & WM R "WRA <RI
WlEdT, 2023 (2023 BT 45) BT GRT 13 T YR ARTRS GRET iR, 2023 (2023 BT 46) DI &RT
394 AT 401" ¥g, fog QIR 3 I G |




18. EIIRT 99 BT HMEH.—c IMMAFRH BT &R 99 H —

(@) SU—arT (5) ® “I" fag @ WM W v o @ S iR dowEnq efaRad
faxenfua fear g, srifa—

R 909 B Had B b oy vEmgd dmfa B @ 69 9Rg g9rd
AT & 9T & swEREE Marel S, e ot iR AR |9r |
IS IR SN d8a H AU fBar S |7; 3iR

(@) SU—oRT (6) H "' forg & = w® g @ S iR qowan AefaRad
Rd AT AT g, seria—

Reg 999 B Fa IR B forg e uRug [ 8 69 w9 Rfar akvg
@ AP & EREREM Mol Sel, Ree oy drifaR srgaed a9 | SHa!
R AN d3h H AU fham SITgam | |

19. ©RT 115 &1 YARMIF—T ARTH @ gRT 115 & WM R F=faRaa @
ST, Srfq——
“115. FHTAT B IYell.—(1) YT B Al yad gRT (Al Ffdd | S1ar B
A fHdr R, O &, v, &I a1 {6l 3 IbH & i &l el Bg U
Ifdd Bl AT TR HRb T TP HEH SSTUT |
2) 9Hg wrs AeN AR, daa Affa iR UM dard @1 99d U Ffdadl

R VT I <0 2 5 e 9fed Sl Y9 & <IN deraex dI URd & |

(3) dRE T IRIGN APGRT e uRyg @1 a9d (9 Afedal =9 06 649 <1
2 I Gl Ald ST IPH D AR HeTde” bl UK DA |

(4) WEIT ERT JM@T BT TS IHH Y—RIORd & BT & WU H Holde’ gRT G Bl Sl
A

R V¥ WROR I gRI fBHrEe Yoo Y—XroiRd Afafam, 1953 (1954 ol
NffH Adid 6) @ T fhll 3 IR BT HeAdes @I wfdaqal &1 JANT
T B oy Fga wx |qal | |

20. §RT 120 &1 HAMeH—Tc JMAFTH P oRT 120 H SU—oRT (3) & YA
frafaRaa era=enfia faar o, srerfa—

“(4) afe o dard, U MafEE AT gRT Aty &RisA SR &-1 & uwETq
JIRER uRRIT AT TF— AR §RT IESHR AT fBl 3 SR 4§ ST T8l DI
S © A geEradl Ifod Ul UERId @) S1af J5d &I IR UAdl & AT—WTe
| |

21. ORT 12177 &7 JTRMUA— AWM @ a)1 121-9 & ygarq F-faRaa
JraRefua far S, srifa—
"121—77. AT @ @& o Hiue H ewd 8 R REA A uiiied S1ier @t

THETE B ST & fb dls Afdd—

(@) 39 IR & 9 nfed AT iR vy @& iRk fales & @ o |diue |
IAB B AT T ; AT




(@) S9® gRT WU 7Y oy fIfzd urey & IR 78l 7 ; 3R

(M) SHd foU BIS BT egd T WIS 8l o, Al 98 [ared YAl & ™ Bl
Rt fafam ISR BT Ao, S Ious § ISR oMey gRT U Uamrdy &l
TEd & oy g O SR USIEERT 8 @ oIy (IS19=), # Sfesl & YdTed &l
ARG ¥ A9 9y @ oy 7 FRRET aiffd & ok Faffaa ueafert & farem
DI I IS HI:

Ry Pl VAT YARN VA 3fQT & UM A O e @1 3@ & die”
HUSTgE Dl ATl BR Db R SHHT AT HfH S| |

22. ORT 122 PT FAE.—T SMAFIA B aRT 122 H—

() SU oRT (1) H—-

(i) @vs (@W@) #H MR T M RN AT B, YRl B U 59 ddb
5 U IR ST U 3ITeRT & aR | WIigd JAedr) &1 ey e
T § W U™ Y DI BT DI fEAM 7 B TAT BRI by
ST,

(i) @Woe (F) H "3TRE P ANHE ST T & ¥R & Ugar] Sd ddb
SHP! ARG | U 9 P FIAES BT EHNE A B AT Y IR
Sﬁzqﬁﬁﬁmﬁﬁ;

(i) @ve (§) #, "gvs Ufhar Hfdn, 1973 &I aRT 110" ¥ex, fog 3R &l @&
WM R 4R ANTRS GRAT |idn, 2023° (2023 &7 46) wes, g 3R

(iv) @vs () & WP BT v [T ST ;

(@) SU arT (1) & gwan FrefoRad siaenfua fear S, srerfa—

‘(1—a) A Bz Yd USIEPRI, TaR—Id & Bl g7 31 F a1 = |qeaiy o
¥ 9% TP YR B © B B, ARG, g, gHUA g QT Uil
ST & AT Sl JFaR & AT SFd bl $ °gR IUel & HRU IHD §RT 88 o
S G b SHS U Blied W B8 a4 DI A B FG 7 B TAT I, TAI
@1 DI TRIRBN g7 T G for Prefe g i

(@) SU GRT (2) § “(1)" PISd AR 3fF & LA AT SU GRT (1%)" HISdH, JeR
3R i@ Tl fhy S |

23. GRT 133 BT FEH—T JRTTH @1 9T 133 @1 U gRT (1) # “Fwa” I &
T AT S GRT UTeIad dlg =g SfeHNI” ea AU fby S |

24. TRT 134 BT HAEA.— AT B gR_T 134 H -

(@) SU ORI (2) & @os (B) H “Riem uRyg” oal & ygarq a1 Fus’ o 3f:
zerfud fdby SITeT;

@) 9 aRT 3) @ @Wos (B) #, “Riem uRvg” wel & uwad a1 fewe a1 g
RGN Ieg TG by SITe |

25. €RT 142 BT WATT— AT BT IRT 142 H—



(@) ST gRT (1) # "USI¥eR),” ¥ iR g & uvarq "driad H I0Hl Sy & SR
U4 USRI e JfaRefud fdhy S |

(@) SY URT (2) B uzanq freforRad siqRenfia fevar s, srerfq——

"3) v Wt fafaa, wfder, e daaweh, srsedd A1 g Ao SmETRa
HHATRAT O B AMIAT, TTH JIOHTR FER-IB, Th-Idh! A8, @I Ud 31
THE BIffDl, S GEREdl 9o YR e fdmT grr g e ™ € @
SRR Y RuiRa fear smom, afe 9 S 9iU U sl &1 uTadd R #
IAHA Y& § IT U FHaidi Bl gled Frd; daaral 3 a1 Fdel & AR 781 axd
M

26. SRT 144 & GIRM—I JARAFTTH 3 gRT 144 & T g9R_7 B) & @vs (@) #,
qUS UfshaT Afedl, 1973 & ST 7 & UG edl, forvg 3R o/l & H W HRAR™ ARG
JReAT AT, 2023 (2023 FT 46) & AR 7 & Sy Tex, fIg 3R 3fd I U |

27. ©RT 145 BT WATT— IMAIH BT IRT 145 H—
(@) SU-aRT (1) H—
(i) @vs (®) & E R =faRaa w@r S, -

"(@) S JIVSH ARMT AT JAT & [y dlgs a7 A Ae® @1 @ & forg
AfRETT § &1 B W e favg IR =g <Gfedn, 2023 & AT 4, 7, 9,
10, 13 3R AT 5 BT YR 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70(1), 70(2), 71, 80, 88
W 94 TP, 99 AR JT 6 BT TRT 103, 104, 107, 108, 109, 141, 146 AT 17
3R sy 18 dI ORI 310(2), (3), 311, 312, 316(4), (5) 318(4), 326(5), 331(6)
3R (8) T, 3R IT BAMae U MEHNT IIfATH, 2011 & AT 6 BT GRT
39 ¥ 59 Td AT RTH AURET A dTeid] BT ARETU TRAfTIH, 2012 AT AR
faror rffw, 1988 @ @1ENE AT @rer AR 3R SNl smfsrr & AR,
Rl qen qrael & IR H IMfue AUR g4 3R Rifde iRl & <Refor
Al ToERd U9 el o fafY & orfia 6=l <ifiss driafzal # R
faxfoa fog v &

W] 39 WS & FdM (Bl USSR B Melfdd s b oIy aR™ U3 &
1 BRI I8N Aifed ORI B+ PI 3MMaeahal el aril R fdfaa fhar
T BIs N yeder), e favg el smuifde ariad § R faxfd
fru v € Werm =maTerm & sifad vty 9o fadfaa =

W] I8 AR & Bl MRIE IRM a1 o= SR ¥ dies a7 9 &1fd®
9 T foRad # e @ d1e Hefdd feu U ueiert b1 e e @R
fear S afe srawor f¥eRor gRT fevmad @l AN ¥ BE AN $ AR
[eTH RIS ¥ IRIY U5 WA el fhar S 2 &R

(i) SU—9RT (1) & Wb BT Y fHAT ST |

(@) ST—URT (—%) & wIF R FEfeRad w@r S, ferid—



"2—%) JU-GRT (1) & @ (1) AT SU-GRT (2) B 3rEefe el U=IOdRI &1 T4
e fAefed =81 fear S o9 9@ 6 S, IorRefd, oRy 9o a1 uRM®
St a7 AR a1 oikar weiem Ruie @ ufd & A1r BROT Idel Afed SR
HRD IH Al Bl AR 9 ¢ &1 A1 17

SU—GRT (3) H, "SU—arRT (1) A7 (2)" v<<l, o=l 3R 3fd & WM R ST—oRT (1)
®T Gus (1) Y URT (2) ¥, &g 3R i AT ST 3R

(8) SU-uRT (3) B gwEnd FrEfoRad srdenfia fear s, sierfd—

"(3—%) T AW #, I gRT 146 @ MefT Wi BE AN & AR G A8l B ®, o
ST R dTell SRl Heftd Uil &l forRad § SR IRgd N 3R 59
3rfcrRe o8 A1 & oy T aR fawdR faan S | |

(3—w) afe <& faifaa gl @ iR 9 Y & IgaR oa # MEarT &1 &
foru I ©, 1 fcied 3MeY B 719 &) JHINT & 918 XE ol fhar S 3R S
IfHRY iR raf & iR THaR®T Siid & oIy T 97T |

(3—7T) S URT B SU—URT (3) B T Aciead & URIERT BT MY ORI 146 B
I S B g g gHIfad A8l HWT ofd db b b1 Ty Adal A8 S
2"

() SU—urRI (4) ¥ fore "I, @ WM W R @ S SR aoErd refaRad
ST fha STTQT, eria—

Reg I vadl & Faifd geifeRal o g9 dmr de Fefea ax) e
Torgfd g9 FE R ©, A o0 WRGR AT VAT W rT o fafed faar s wdted
I /T & et w, W 9fifa oy aftd @it @ te et fiea ax
|, ST U FEfed geieeRal wosifos Aok «fdd e 9@ demaa &1 erfhal

BT I, A BT Ul 3R Bl b7 fdgT af ||

()

28. ORI 151 HT URRAUA— JRAFIH B aRT 151 & WH R =foiad wn
SITQT, ferf—

“151. frdl 9e UEIfeRNT a1 99e gRT Sfder A fRd afdia o= @ forw
IMRT——3IT T=RIT &1 Bls IS AT USIGRT AT Wdd, Uarad & A1 AT 39 b
ERT T SIH!T 3R A BT T3 dfder a1 fbu v B Feq # ucuerd: a1 ivcerd:
DS dgfddd 3fer a1 f2d, S g S1fSid &_dl & df 99 @ IR § I8 FHsM S
5 SO YR = <R, 2023 (2023 BT 45) BT ORT 202 & T TURET BT B |

WEHU.—d gRT b YA & 70 "Uod & A" & Idid qaed afdaford & or
TAd BT MY wieeRl iR S uIR#AE & S & f[JeaR #§ oy 997 vergd 9 darRd
g1

29. YRT 152 P HIMEF.—A AT @1 a7 152 H, "WRAT < AT, 1860 B &RT
341" Treg), fogl @R 3fdl & WM WR, "R <1 Sfedl, 2023 (2023 &7 45) @1 ORT 126 (2)”
vreg, forg, @R 3fd g ST |

30. ©RT 155 T WAEH— ARTTH & g7 155 # fIemE Suar &1 (1) & w9 A
wifea fdhar SO &R, doawar MfaRad ra-venfua fdbar S, srefq—



4

“2) Dis afp, folt ufafe & o=l frafae Ammaeh & wftaforg
afsfa feu Siv & Gee & filRad v & &I U= a1 =9on Hrar & o e
R Rrad fear 89 &1 a1 a1 SS9 FF ® a7 fava § a1 e 9@ 89 @1
fearg 761 © A1 98 AN ¥, W Ud §9R ®UY & B G, afvsd
ST | |

g9 .

31. YRT 156—T P WM.~ IAIH B aRT 158— H—

(@) e # AdeE & 9" weal & ggarq iR T & Q" ves s fahg
\_rﬂ'Q'ﬁ; 3N

(@) SU-uRT (1) ¥ ‘A4S &3 #' UK & U R "G & At wes

ar=aRenfud fy S |

32. GRT 160 BT WARF.——TA AR @ gRT 160 B SUIRT (1) & o H, “ " e
% I o @1 S |iR S yvErq EfaRad siasenfud faar S, sternid—

IR Bl (4 Afth R I faied 3mgeh & wd 4 YR & forw faar fawar
ST, T @75 AT I WRBR H Yu—T¢ I7 07— & Ug R 19 a9 b BRI
frar &1 iR S fafew (Fafedl) & 9o &1 o/ gva & 91 S9a vg 318
Jbar AT furfia Aeer fdd 7 8

W] I8 SR b PR &1 9 g Adddr MR YAOT-9F W e
ST ||

33. URT 160—% &1 HINF—T JRAFTH B gRT 160-F H, TR WHR' TR &l
FEl A & & W R Rl (afes SR vrea 9 SI9 |

34. YRT 161 BT WARE.— ¥ JRTH & a1 161 & @ (jii) H "IMgF I=< B
I UN HUscllYdd Rleq XY STTUAT |

35. ORT 167 BT FIEE.—H AMAFRH & aRT 167 & IT—GRT (2) H, WRAT A
rfrfeE, 1872 vTeal, forel oIk ofbl & R IR ey I H, 2023 (2023 BT 47) ¥T<g,
forg 3R 3fd g SIUT |

36. ©RT 169 HT FIMEM——Td JIRTTH H gRT 169 I SU—uRT (2) H ‘v ufhar

Wi, 1973 B GRT 345 AR 346" eal, gl 3R bl & WM W MR ANRS GReT Az,
2023 (2023 BT 46) ® GRT 384 3R 385" Ieq, g 3R 3fdh W ST |

37. gRT 172 $T HARH—A MA@ gRT 172 H "WRA gve <dfdn, 1860 &
AT 9—&" weal, gl 3R fdi & WM W "R /g Sfedl, 2023 & AR 9" e, g
IR b I SN |

38. ©RT 186 BT HEH.—Hel IMMAFTIA BT gRT 186 & IU—GRT (3) H, "wA fFraq” vl
& UL IAAFTIH B GRT 135 & A 991¢ Y A & A wes sidwentud fBg S |

39. TRT 190 BT HIARM—H JRATH B gRT 190 H, “IRAT SvS WA, 1860 B LRI
21 @ 3" vreal, forgl @R ofhl & I IR =TT Sfgdr 2023 & oRT 2(28)d 3rf” vex, feg
IR b "I ST |




40. ITA —3 BT URARINIA— AT A FHeltd JJFA—3 & W R =foriaa
T SITQT, 3feffd—

& —3
(&RT 32 <)
I TR §RT 9 TURTET
e | st ar dfear &AM JTURTY &TRT
1. AR <9 AGfedl, 2023 | WoodT SUBHA HIRA HRAT | 115
2. YR =g GiEdl, 2023 | YbIUd UR WesT SUBfd bRl | 122 (1)
3. ARAT <1 Gf2dl, 2023 | FaIY 3[aR | 126
4. RO =i Gf2dl, 2023 | TR YDA 89 9 3T 9T B+ AT RIS | 131
ol BT YA PR & AT 30 |
5. ARAG =1 dfedl, 2023 | G| 194
6. RO =g AT, 2023 FHAT DI I AT NI BRATel 9 g9 & ol | 206
BRR &l ST |
7. TR <1 AT, 2023 T D dMId BT AT Y BRIArEl Bl AT S9D | 207
UBTI BT FHaRor e |
8. RO =T Gfedr, 2023 | 39 A7 UfAsTE 9 SR GRAT, Sdfh e dad | 213
ERT 98 O &_4 & foly IR=Id w9 9 3ruferd faan
STy |
0. IR =g Gf2dl, 2023 | U &R @ oIl UTgd ol W $I SRk o1 4 | 214
SPR BT |
10. HRA =g Gfedl, 2023 | BT TR SWER B A SHR HRAT | 215
11. IR =1 Gidl, 2023 | <& HRIAE § 46 8¢ Ald Hdd B ARM | 267
YA AT SAD BT F e |

12. | 9Rdim =g A@fgdn 2023 | SUETQUl BRI ORI Silad @ foll AUl AT @I | 271
RHHYT B qRT B |
13. | YRCY 1Y WEd], 2023 | Alb ST AT SIARE Bl el bgivd BT | 279

14, | 9RO =g W@, 2023 | A6 ART A7 A1 UREET 9 H Hhe AT 9T | 285
15. | IRAI g WfEdn, 2023 | Af AT SAoRia ucrRl @GR H o Suemyel | 287
3ITeRY |
16. | 9R<i™ =g Afgdn, 2023 | [ORBIed UR & 9% H SUTYOl 3{TeR | 288
17. IR =g Afedt, 2023 | [l AT B FRM, SHS! G B AT GEHE [ 290
BT B qEE H IUATYOf SITER |
18. | WY =AY WEAl, 2023 | Sia—olw] & T H SUETYUl TR | 291
19. | YR =g W@, 2023 | oI SrUETT HEC! H Wdid gH & fol gvs | 292
20. | 9T = R, 2023 | grecfier o aiR Y| 296
21. AR ST AT, 2023 | argerferg =grani | 316 (1aiR 2)
22, | RAN W AR 2023 | ¢ o wefy 317 (18iR 2)
23, AR =T e, 2023 | g 318 (1&iR 2)
24, | W S e 2023 | R (g ar = 1,000 T B qed 0P 324 (14K 5)

25, | MNCIA W e, 2023 | g g @1 aw By a1 99 Rwer awd g | 325
Rfte| (1,000 39 & oI TP) |

26. TRA™ <Y dfedl, 2023 SRR SRR R e | 329

27. AT =T e, 2023 | Gygranfg T aRE @ USIRG W B e | 392
AR YA |

08, | FRCHT =T W, 2023 | g wfam gRT e <o STaAR | 355

29 31 s, 1880 (1880 | IRT 22 & WUE (@) (W) R (F) @ =¥Id I dTel | ORI 22 & TS
R ELEE) ITIRTEN BT TS (1) & Rara |




30, | g dfrar sifafrem, 1871 | g3l & AUEY BT Torudeh fARIE BRAT rdT S | 24
G |
31, | TY Sifre sfefEm, 1871 | GIRT g1 4 A1 Bl MR AAVIIG TSP Pl | 26

JHRATT Ugdr AT SIIT |

30 | THree yw fheR (U | dTefdl ®I dHIg 9o & forg 2mRe | 3
fver) arfarferm, 1952

33. ferrae Ueel fheiR (e | 9o e § fHeiR 9 dW@q &1 IWE | 4
fver) arfarferm, 1952 BT |

34, | wEGe A SMFRM, | g R BT WMl B A1 SW dod AT ¥R | 3
1867 (1867 T 2) qed B @ forg wnlRe |

35. |wEue A (Ul | JamER H U SN @ fofg e | 4
Hgfei)arferfrm, 1867
(1867 BT 2)

36. |WHGMe  Td  (dfds | PRWIR @fddal W Tdd M R Udr o & fog | 7
Trgferm)srfafram, 1867 | 2R |

(1867 T 2)
37. |9dee Td  ofafem, | 39 ofafma @ awmr 22, 158 3R 187 @ SR
1867 (1867 T 2) JTURTE |

Seedt 3R BRI BT HUH
fedrae uaer vdERcl RS I, 1994 H gEe Sudwl @ adam faffe &R
TeTNIfS GERT & AT UHwudl o 2q AL U S @) el € | ARG = |,
2023 MRA ANTRS GRET Wf2dl, 2023 3R 9RAR ey fSf™, 2023 & ARFHT 89 4

g IR gvs fedr, 1860, gvs Ufshar wfedr, 1973 QIR YRAIT @Ry INfRIfTH, 1872 &
eyt o1 gferenfia om sifeard 81 7am 2 |

[T Suel Afed ol gfafifee sifafem, 1951 &1 a6l R gArg JuRT BT GRIAMUT B
DI UG AT © | IE GAIdl & BRIGAMl DI Id BB, Feras, T3 B a_gell B qrad
RGN 3R MfEmIRaT Jedi ¥ gfg d3, fa<ia ufbamell & gegaRed &= iR gemafie
WAl UG R & §RT YGoIHRUT PRl R Al Fferd ¢ |

AT Heed g SMURIEe fafer § yewudt gHRad &=+, Al Ufshan o gedl )
A, RN BRG] § IR B, UhIRI B TRABIU AR URIHGIRAT HT ITRATIE
qTT TG M 2 |

Ie fdee Sua Sgawl @l gid & fou © |

freg i)
TR 773 |



grAfoTd faem aw= s
_'31\7\):[_

e uewr rrame_ﬁ_wr (Feiee) fada®, 2025

fEArad gae Ul o1 STITRIA, 1994 (1994 T SR H&dh 4) HI 3R FIEH
T & forg faee |

@ reg RiE)
TR 731 |

(ERT AR TATe)
afaa (fafe) |

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Bill No. 19 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES
Clauses:

Short title.

Amendment of section 2.
Amendment of section 4.
Amendment of section 5.
Amendment of section 5-B.
Amendment of section 7-A.
Amendment of section 9.
Amendment of section 31.
Amendment of section 32.
Amendment of section 33.
Amendment of section 38.

POOWXONOA~WNE

P



12.
13.
14.
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.
22.
23.
24.
25.
26.
217.
28.
29.
30.
31.
32.
33.
34.
35.
36.
37.
38.
39.
40.

Amendment of section 39.
Amendment of section 40.
Amendment of section 41.
Amendment of section 60.
Amendment of section 64.
Amendment of section 76.
Amendment of section 99.
Substitution of section 115.
Amendment of section 120.
Insertion of section 121-C.
Amendment of section 122.
Amendment of section 133.
Amendment of section 134.
Amendment of section 142.
Amendment of section 144.
Amendment of section 145.
Substitution of section 151.
Amendment of section 152.
Amendment of section 155.

Amendment of section 158-R.

Amendment of section 160.

Amendment of section 160-A.

Amendment of section 161.
Amendment of section 167.
Amendment of section 169.
Amendment of section 172.
Amendment of section 186.
Amendment of section 190.

Substitution of SCHEDULE —lIlIlI.

Bill No. 19 of 2025

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(As INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)

A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (Act No. 4 of 1994).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

1.

2.
1994 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),—

Short title—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj
(Amendment) Act, 2025.

Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act,



(@ in clause (22), for the words, signs and figures * section 2 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973”, the words, sign and figures “section 2 of the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023(46 of 2023)” shall be substituted; and

(b) in clause (35), for the words, signs and figures “section 21 of the Indian Penal
Code, 1860 ”, the words, signs and figures “section 2 (28) of the Bhartiya Nyaya
Sanhita, 2023(45 of 2023)” shall be substituted .

3. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the
following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) If any person makes in connection with,—

(@) the preparation, revision or correction of an electoral roll; or
(b) the inclusion or exclusion of any entry in or from an electoral roll,

a statement or declaration in writing which is false and which he either knows or
believes to be false or does not believe to be true, he shall be punished as per section
155.”,

4. Amendment of section 5.—In section 5 of the principal Act,—
(@) insub-section (1),
(1) insecond proviso,—

(A) after the words “Deputy Commissioner”, the words “or the Director”
shall be inserted;

(B) for the figures “30” and for the words “an extra-ordinary general
meeting”, the words “three” and “a special meeting” shall be
substituted respectively; and

(if) in third proviso for the word “thirty”, the word *“seven” shall be substituted,;
(b) insub-section (3),-

(i) after the word “general”, the words “or a special” shall be inserted; and

(if) in the end of the proviso for the sign“.” the sign *:” shall be substituted and
thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that a special meeting organised for the purpose of
awareness of general public and celebration of any day etc., shall not be
adjourned for want of quorum.”.

5.  Amendment of section 5-B.—In section 5-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the figure and words “8th March”, the words “first Sunday of February” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 7-A.—In section 7-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),

for the sign “.” the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following shall be inserted,
namely:—



“Provided that the Pradhan of the Gram Panchayat should be invited as a special
invitee in the meetings of Up-Gram Sabha and the Pradhan may attend the said
meetings.”.

7.  Amendment of section 9.—In section 9 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the
words “shall be public and” shall be omitted.

8. Amendment of section 31.—In section 31 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for
the words, signs and figures “the Criminal Procedure Code, 1973, the words, sign and figures “the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 32.—In section 32 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),—

(@) for the words, signs and figures “section 125 of the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973”, the words, sign and figures “section 144 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha
Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) ” shall be substituted; and

(b) for the words “five hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of section 33.—In section 33 of the principal Act, for the words * not
exceeding one hundred”, the words “which may extend to one thousand” shall be substituted.

11. Amendment of section 38.—In section 38 of the principal Act,—

(@ in clause (b), for the words, signs and figures “section 379 of the Indian Penal
Code”, the words, signs and figures “section 303(2) of the Bharatiya Nyaya
Sanhita , 2023 (45 of 2023) ” shall be substituted; and

(b) inclause (c), for the words, signs and figures “sections 109 or 110 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, signs and figures “sections 128 or 129
of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023(46 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 39.—In section 39 of the principal Act, for the words “two
hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

13. Amendment of section 40.—In section 40 of the principal Act, for the words, signs
and figures “section 202 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973, the words, sign and figures
“section 225 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 203) ” shall be substituted.

14. Amendment of section 41.—In section 41 of the principal Act,—

(@ in sub-section (1), for the words “two thousand”, the words “twenty five
thousand” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand” shall
be substituted.

15. Amendment of section 60.—1In section 60 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), for
the words, signs and figures “the Indian Evidence Act, 1872, the Code of Criminal Procedure,
1973”, the words, signs and figures “ the Bhartiya Sakshya Adhiniyam, 2023 (47 of 2023), the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) ” shall be substituted.



16. Amendment of section 64.—In section 64 of the principal Act,—

(@)

(b)

in sub-section (2), for the words, sign and figures “section 7 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973” , the words, sign and figures “section 7 of the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)” shall be substituted ; and

in sub-section (5), for the words, number, sign and figures “Chapter XXXIII of
the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 ” , the words, number, sign and figures
“Chapter XXXIV of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)
shall be substituted.

17. Amendment of section 76.—In section 76 of the principal Act, for the words, signs
and figures “section 75 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 or section 356 or 360 of Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, sign and figures “section 13 of the Bhartiya Nyaya
Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) ” or sections 394 or 401 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita,
2023 (46 of 2023) ” shall be substituted.

18. Amendment of section 99.—In section 99 of the principal Act,—

(@)

(b)

in sub-section (5), for the sign *.”, the sign “ : ” shall be substituted and thereafter
the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that for making the payment of salary, the amount from the Panchayat
Samiti Fund may be withdrawn under the signature of the Secretary of the
concerned Panchayat Samiti, for which ex-post facto approval shall be obtained
from the House in its immediate next meeting.”; and

in sub-section (6), for the sign “.”, the sign “ : ” shall be substituted and thereafter
the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that for making the payment of salary, the amount from the Zila
Parishad fund may be withdrawn under the signature of the Secretary of the
concerned Zila Parishad, for which ex-post facto approval shall be obtained from
the House in its immediate next meeting.”.

19. Amendment of section 115.—For section 115 of the principal Act, the following shall
be substituted, namely:—

“115. Recovery of arrears.—(1) The Secretary of the Panchayat shall take all
necessary steps for the recovery of arrears of any tax, water rate, rent, fee, or any other
sum claimable by the Panchayat from any person, by issuing a notice of recovery to
such person.

(2) The Block Development Officer concerned shall furnish to the Collector the details
of the amount recoverable, along with a list of persons from whom such amount is due,
in respect of the Panchayat Samiti and the Gram Panchayat.

(3) The Chief Executive Officer concerned shall furnish to the Collector the details of
the amount recoverable, along with a list of persons from whom such amount is due, in
respect of the Zila Parishad.



20.

(4) The amount claimable by a Panchayat may be recovered by the Collector as an
arrear of land revenue:

Provided that the State Government may, by order, appoint any other officer to
exercise the powers of the Collector under the Himachal Pradesh Land Revenue Act,
1953 (6 of 1954).”.

Amendment of section 120.—In section 120 of the principal Act, after sub-section

(3), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

21.

“(4) If a Panchayat is not constituted due to force-majeure conditions or boycott by
general public or due to some other reasons after the issue of election programme by
the State Election Commission, the term of such Panchayat constituted later on shall
run concurrently with other Panchayats of the State.”.

Insertion of section 121-C.—After section 121-B of the principal Act, following shall

be inserted, namely:—

“121-C. Disqualification for failure to lodge account of election expenses.—If the
authorised officer is satisfied that,—

(@) the candidate has failed to lodge an account of election expenses within the time
and in the manner required by or under this Act; or

(b) the account lodged by the candidate are not in accordance with prescribed format,
and

(c) the candidate has no good reason or justification for the failure mentioned in
clause (a) or (b), above,

he shall, forward the names of such contesting candidates to the District Election
Officer, who shall by order published in the Gazette, declare such candidates
disqualified for being chosen as, and for being office bearer, of a Panchayat for a
period of three years from the date of publication of the order in the Gazette and
declare the election of the elected office bearer to be void:

Provided that any such candidate may file an appeal to the Divisional Commissioner
within a period of 30 days from the publication of such order and his order shall be
final.”.

22. Amendment of section 122.—In section 122 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) inclause (bb), after the words “section 180 of this Act”, the words “unless a
period of six years has elapsed from the date on which the finding of the
authorised officer as to such practice has been given” shall be inserted;

(i) in clause (d), after the words “for the time being in force”, the words
“unless a period of six years has elapsed since his conviction” shall be
inserted;



(b)

(©

(iii) in clause (e), for the words, sign and figures “section 110 of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, sign and figures “section 129 of the
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 46 of 2023) ” shall be substituted;
and

(iv) the proviso to clause (n) shall be omitted;
after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1-A) If an Ex-Office bearer is found guilty for loss, misappropriation, waste, or
misapplication of any money or fund or other property of the Panchayat to which
he has been a party, or which has been caused by him by misconduct or gross
negligence of his duties unless a period of six years has elapsed since his
demitting the office, shall be disqualified for being chosen as an office bearer of a
Panchayat.”; and

in sub-section (2), after sign and figure *“(1)”, the words, signs, and figure
“or sub-section (1-A)” shall be inserted.

23. Amendment of section 133.—In section 133 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
after the word “Director”, the words “or any other officer authorised by him” shall be inserted.

24. Amendment of section 134.—In section 134 of the principal,—

(@)

(b)

in sub-section 2, in clause (g), after the words “Zila Parishad”, the words “or the
Director” shall be inserted; and

in sub-section 3, in clause (g), after the words “Zila Parishad”, the words “or the
Director or the State Government” shall be inserted.

25. Amendment of section 142.—In section 142 of the principal Act,-

(@)

(b)

in sub-section (1), after the words and sign “office bearer,”, the words and sign
“Ex-office bearer during his tenure in the office” shall be inserted; and

after sub-section (2), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) The responsibility of concerned regular, contractual, daily wage, outsourced
or other scheme based employees like Junior Engineers, Gram Rojgar Sahayaks,
Technical Assistants, Accountants and other similar workers engaged by the
Panchayats and the Panchayati Raj Department shall also be fixed, in case they
fail to perform the duties assigned to them or do not perform such duties with due
diligence or in accordance with the instructions.

26. Amendment of section 144.—In section 144 of the principal Act, in sub-section 3, in
clause (b), for the words, signs and figures “Provisions of Chapter VII of the Code of Criminal
Procedure, 1973”, the words, signs, and figures  “provisions of Chapter VII of the Bhartiya
Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

27. Amendment of section 145.—In section 145 of the principal Act,—

(@)

in sub-section (1),—

(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:—



(b)

(©)

(d)

“(a) who remained in custody for more than fourteen days on a criminal
charge or otherwise or against whom charges have been framed in any
criminal proceedings under chapter 1V, VI, 1X, X, XIII, sections 63, 64, 65,
66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 80, 88 to 94, 99 of chapter V, sections 103,104, 107,
108, 109, 141, 146 of chapter VI, sections 310(2) and (3), 311, 312, 316(4)
and (5), 318(4), 326 (g), 331(6) and (8) of Chapter XVII and Chapter XVIII
of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 or sections 39 to 59 of Chapter-VI of
the Himachal Pradesh Excise Act, 2011 (33 of 2012) or the Protection of
Children from Sexual Offences Act, 2012 (32 of 2012) or the Prevention of
Corruption Act, 1988 (49 of 1988) or any other law for the time being in
force for the prevention of adulteration of food stuff and drugs, suppression
of immoral traffic in women and children and protection of civil rights:

Provided that for suspending any office bearer under this clause there shall be no
requirement to issue show cause notice along with chargesheet and any office
bearer, placed under suspension against whom charges have been framed in any
criminal proceedings shall remain under suspension, till the final decision of the
competent court :

Provided further that the suspension of an office bearer placed under suspension
after remaining in custody for more than fourteen days on a criminal charge or
otherwise shall be revoked, if chargesheet is not produced by the investigating
agencies in the competent court within six months from the date of custody;”;
and

(if) the proviso to sub-section (1) shall be deleted.
for sub-section (2-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2-A) No office bearer shall be placed under suspension under clause (c) of sub-
section (1) or sub-section (2) unless he has been given an opportunity of being
heard by issuing a show cause notice along with a copy of chargesheet or
preliminary inquiry or inspection or audit report, as the case may be.”;

in sub-section (3), for the words, signs and figures “sub-section (1) or (2)”, the
words, signs and figures “clause (c) of sub-section (1) or sub-section (2)” shall be
substituted; and

after sub-section (3), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3-A) In cases, where inquiry under section 146 is not completed within six
months, the officer holding inquiry shall furnish reasons in writing to concerned
authority and further, one time extension for six month may be given.

(3-B) Where the delay is on the part of the elected representative for non-
cooperation in the inquiry in accordance with law, the suspension order shall not
be revoked after expiry of six months and the inquiry officer shall further proceed
for ex-parte inquiry within stipulated period.

(3-C) The order of revocation of suspension under sub-section (3) of said section
shall not affect the inquiry under section 146 until it is concluded.”.



(e) in sub-section (4), for the sign “.”, the sign *:” shall be substituted and thereafter
the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in case the elected office bearers of a Panchayat are suspended to
the extent that the number of remaining elected office bearers do not fulfill the
quorum required for convening a meeting of the Panchayat, then the State
Government or the authority as may be prescribed, may constitute a committee of
persons along with head of such committee on the recommendations of Gram
Sabha concerned, to exercise the powers, perform the duties and discharge the
functions of the Panchayat until the final decision is pending on such suspended
office bearers.”.

28. Substitution of section 151.—For section 151 of the principal Act, the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“151. Penalty for acquisition by a member, office bearer or servant of interest in
contracts.—If a member or office bearer or servant of Panchayat knowingly acquires,
directly or indirectly any personal share or interest in any contract or employment with,
by or on behalf of a Panchayat, he shall be deemed to have committed an offence
under section 202 of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023).

“Explanation:—For the purposes of this section *“servant of panchayat” shall include
all the employee who are serving in Panchayats irrespective of appointing authority
not being the Panchayat and irrespective of the source of their remuneration.”.

29. Amendment of section 152.—In section 152 of the principal Act, for the words, signs
and figures “section 341 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860, the words, signs and figures “section
126 (2) of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023)  shall be substituted.

30. Amendment of section 155.—In section 155 of the principal Act, the existing
provision shall be numbered as (1) and thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) If any person makes in connection with, the inclusion or exclusion of any entry in
or from an electoral roll, a statement or declaration in writing which is false and which
he either knows or believes to be false or does not believe to be true, he shall be
punished with fine of five thousand rupees.”.

31. Amendment of section 158-R.—In section 158-R of the principal Act,—

(@) in heading, after the words “distributed on Polling day”, the words “and counting
day” shall be inserted; and

(b) in sub-section (1), after the words “ in that polling area”, the words “and on the
day of counting” shall be inserted.

32. Amendment of section 160.—In section 160 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
at the end for the sign “.” the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided that only such person shall be considered for appointment as State Election
Commissioner who has worked for twenty years in a Group-A or Class-1 post in the



Central or State Government with experience of conducting elections and there is no
vigilance or departmental case pending against him:

Provided further that the Vigilance Clearance Certificate shall also be obtained before
making appointment.”.

33. Amendment of section 160-A.—In section 160-A of the principal Act, for the words
“State Government”, wherever occurs the words “District Election Officer” shall be substituted.

34. Amendment of section 161.—In section 161, in clause (iii), for the word
“Commissioner”, the words “Divisional Commissioner” shall be substituted.

35. Amendment of section 167.—In section 167 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words, signs and figures “Indian Evidence Act, 1872”, the words, sign and figures
“Bhartiya Sakshya Adhiniyam , 2023 (47 of 2023) ” shall be substituted.

36. Amendment of section 169.—In section 169 of the principal act, for the words, signs
and figures “sections 345 and 346 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 ', the words, signs and
figures “sections 384 and 385 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall
be substituted.

37. Amendment of section 172.—In section 172 of the principal Act, for the words,
signs and figures “Chapter IX-A the Indian Penal Code, 1860” , the words, signs and figures
“Chapter IX of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

38. Amendment of section 186.—In section 186 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
after the words “All rules”, the words “ except the rules framed under section 135(2)”, shall be
inserted.

39. Amendment of section 190.—In section 190 of the principal Act, for the words,
signs, and figure, “the meaning of section 21 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860, the words, signs
and figures “the meaning of section 2(28) of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) ”
shall be substituted.

40. Substitution of SCHEDULE-I11.—For SCHEDULE-III appended to the principle
Act, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“SCHEDULE-II
(See section 32)

OFFENCES COGNIZABLE BY A GRAM PANCHAYAT

No. Nane of Act/Code Offence Section
1 2 3 4
Bhartiya N Sanhita, 2023 . .

1 artlya Nyaya sannia Voluntarily causing hurt 115

2. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Voluntarily causing hurt on provocation 122(1)

3. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Wrongful restraint 126

4, Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Punishment for assault or criminal force otherwise | 131

than on grave provocation.




5. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Affray 194
6. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Absconding to avoid service of summons or other | 206
proceedings.
7. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Preventing service of summons or other | 207
proceedings, or preventing publication thereof.
8. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Refusing oath or affirmation when duly required | 213
by a public servant to make it.
9. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Refusing to answer a public servant authorised to | 214
question.
10. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Refusing to sign statement. 215
11. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Intentional insult or interruption to public servant | 267
sitting in judicial proceeding.
12. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Negligent act likely to spread infection of disease | 271
dangerous life.
13. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Fouling the water or public spring or reservoir. 279
14. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Danger of obstruction in public way or line of | 285
navigation.
15. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Negligent conduct with respect to fire or | 287
combustible matter.
16. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Negligent conduct with respect to explosive | 288
substance.
17. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Negligent conduct with respect to pulling down, | 290
repairing as contructing buildings, etc.
18. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Negligent conduct with respect to animal 291
19. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Pubishment for public nuisance in cases not | 292
otherwise provided for
20. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Obscene acts and songs 296
21. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Criminal breach of trust 316 (1) and (2)
22. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Stolen property 317 (1) and (2)
23. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Cheating 318 (1) and (2)
24. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Mischief (causing damage to property or loss up to | 324 (1) and (2)
Rs. 1000/-).
25. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Mischief by killing or maiming animal (value of | 325
up to Rs. 1000/-).
26. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Criminal trespass and house-trespass 329
27. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Intentional insult with intent to provoke breach of | 352
peace.
28. | Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 | Misconduct in public by a drunken person 355
29. | The Vaccination Act, 1880 Punishment of offences covered by clauses (a), (b) | 22 except clause ( c)
(Act XIII of 1880) and (d) of section 22.
30. | The Cattle Trespass Forcibly opposing the seizure of cattle or re- | 24
Act, 1871 securing the same.
31. | The Cattle Trespass Act, 1871 | Causing damage to land or crops or public roads | 26
by pigs.
32. | The Himachal Pradesh | Penalty for selling tobacco to children 3
Juveniles  (Prevention  of
Smoking) Act, 1952.
33. | The Himachal Pradesh | Seizure of tobacco from juveniles in a public | 4
Juveniles  (Prevention  of | place.
Smoking) Act, 1952.
34. | The Public Gambling Act, | Penalty for owning or keeping or having charge of | 3
1867 (1l of 1867). gambling house.
35. | The Public Gambling Act, | Penalty for being found in a gamblig house 4
1867 (Il of 1867).
36. | The Public Gambling Act, | Penalty on persons arrested for giving false names | 7
1867 (Il of 1867). and address.
37. | The Public Gambling Act, | Offences under sections 22, 158 and 187 under

1867 (11 of 1867).

this Act.”.




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 requires amendments to align its
provisions with recent legal and administrative developments. The enactment of the Bhartiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023, the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023, and the Bhartiya Sakshya
Adhiniyam, 2023, has necessitated substitution of references to the repealed Indian Penal Code,
1860, Criminal Procedure Code, 1973 and the Indian Evidence Act, 1872.

The Bill further proposes to introduce electoral reforms on the analogy of the
Representation of the People Act,1951, including provisions relating to electoral rolls, election
expenses, qualifications, disqualifications and conduct of elections. It also aims to strengthen the
functioning of Panchayats, by enhancing penalties and jurisdictional values, rationalising financial
procedures, and providing administrative clarity with respect to tenure, suspension, recovery of
dues.

The proposed amendments are intended to ensure conformity with the new criminal laws,
streamline electoral processes, improve institutional functioning, simplify procedures, and enhance
accountability of office bearers.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(ANIRUDH SINGH)
Minister-in-Charge.

FINANCIAL MEMORADNUM

-Nil -

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

-Nil-

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

A
BILL



further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (Act No. 4 of 1994).

(ANIRUDH SINGH)
Minister-in-Charge.

(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
Pr. Secretary (Law).

SHIMLA:







	izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu
	MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION


