
fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

fnukad] 1 flrEcj] 2025 
 

 la[;k fo0l0&fo/kk;u&fo/ks;d@1&131@2025-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa dk;Z 
lapkyu  fu;ekoyh] 1973  ds  fu;e&140 ds vUrxZr fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 
2025 ¼2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 19½ tks vkt fnukad 1 flrEcj] 2025 dks fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa 
iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZlk/kkj.k dks lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr fd;k tkrk gSA 
 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
lfpo] 

fg0iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 
 

&&&&&&&&&  
2025 dk foèks;d la[;kad 19- 

 
 

fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2025 
 

[k.Mksa dk Øe 
[k.M% 
 
 1- laf{kIr ukeA 
 2- /kkjk 2 dk la'kks/kuA 
 3- /kkjk 4 dk la'kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 5 dk la'kks/kuA 
 5- /kkjk 5&[k dk la'kks/kuA 
 6- /kkjk 7&d dk la'kks/kuA 
 7- /kkjk 9 dk la'kks/kuA 
 8- /kkjk 31 dk la'kks/kuA 
 9- /kkjk 32 dk la'kks/kuA 
 10- /kkjk 33 dk la'kks/kuA 
 11- /kkjk 38 dk la'kks/kuA 
 12- /kkjk 39 dk la'kks/kuA 
 13- /kkjk 40 dk la'kks/kuA 
 14- /kkjk 41 dk la'kks/kuA 
 15- /kkjk 60 dk la'kks/kuA 
 16- /kkjk 64 dk la'kks/kuA 
 17- /kkjk 76 dk la'kks/kuA 
 18- /kkjk 99 dk la'kks/kuA 
 19- /kkjk 115 dk izfr%LFkkiuA 
 20- /kkjk 120 dk la'kks/kuA 
 21- /kkjk 121 x dk vUr%LFkkiuA 
 22- /kkjk 122 dk la'kks/kuA 
 23- /kkjk 133 dk la'kks/kuA 
 24- /kkjk 134 dk la'kks/kuA 
 25- /kkjk 142 dk la'kks/kuA 



 26- /kkjk 144 dk la'kks/kuA 
 27- /kkjk 145 dk la'kks/kuA 
 28- /kkjk 151 dk izfrLFkkiuA 
 29- /kkjk 152 dk la'kks/kuA 
 30- /kkjk 155 dk la'kks/kuA 
 31- /kkjk 158&n dk la'kks/kuA 
 32- /kkjk 160 dk la'kks/kuA 
 33- /kkjk 160&d dk la'kks/kuA 
 34- /kkjk 161 dk la'kks/kuA 
 35- /kkjk 167 dk la'kks/kuA 
 36- /kkjk 169 dk la'kks/kuA 
 37- /kkjk 172 dk la'kks/kuA 
 38- /kkjk 186 dk la'kks/kuA 
 39- /kkjk 190 dk la'kks/kuA 
 40- vuqlwph&3 dk izfrLFkkiuA 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
 

fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2025 
 

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir :Ik esa½ 
 
 fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 4½ dk vkSj la'kks/ku 
djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA 
 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgRrjosa o"kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :Ik esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks%& 
 
 1-  laf{kIr uke-&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke fgekpy izns”k iapk;rh jkt ¼la”kks/ku½ 
vf/kfu;e] 2025 gSA 
 
 2- /kkjk 2 dk la'kks/ku-&&fgekpy izns”k iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼ftls bllsa blds 
i”pkr~ ßewy vf/kfu;eß dgk x;k gS ½ dh /kkjk 2 esa]& 
 
 ¼d½  [k.M ¼22½ esa] ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 2ß “kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij 

ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 2ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks 
tk,axsA                                                                                                     

 
 ¼[k½  [k.M ¼35½ esa] ßHkkjrh; n.M lafgrk] 1860 dh /kkjk 21ß “kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij 

ßHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 45½ dh èkkjk 2 ¼28½ “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA  
 
 3-  /kkjk 4 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4] dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr 
vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
 ß¼4½ ;fn dksbZ O;fDr]& 
 
  ¼d½  fdlh fuokZpd ukekoyh dh rS;kjh] iqujh{k.k ;k “kqf)( ;k 

   
 



  ¼[k½  fdlh izfof’V ds fdlh fuokZpd ukekoyh esa lfEefyr ;k mlesa vioftZr fd, tkus ds 
lEcU/k esa]  

 

  fyf[kr :i esaa dksbZ dFku ;k ,slh ?kks’k.kk djrk gS tks feF;k gS vkSj ftlds feF;k gksus 
dk ;k rks mls Kku gS ;k fo”okl gS ;k ftlds lR; gksus dk mls fo”okl ugha gS] rks 
og  /kkjk 155 ds vuqlkj nf.Mr fd;k tk,xkAßA 

 

     4-  /kkjk 5 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5 esa]& 
 

  ¼d½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa]&&  
 

   ¼i½  f}rh; ijUrqd esa]&& 
 

    ¼v½ ßmik;qDrß “kCn ds i”pkr~ ß;k funs”kdß “kCn var%LFkkfir fd, tka,xs( vkSj 
 
        ¼vk½ ßrhlß “kCn vkSj ßfo”ks’k cSBdß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ßrhuÞ “kCn vkSj ßfo”ks’k  

cSBdß “kCn Øe”k% j[ks tk,axs( 
 
  ¼ii½  rr̀h; ijUrqd esa] ßrhlß “kCn ds LFkku ij ßlkrÞ “kCn j[kk tk,xk( 
   

  ¼[k½  mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa]& 
 

   ¼i½ ^^lk/kkj.k** 'kCn ds i'pkr~ ^^;k fo'ks"k** 'kCn vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axs( vkSj 
  

      ¼ii½  ijUrqd ds vUr esa] ^^A** fpUg ds LFkku ij ^^%ß fpUg j[kk tk,xk vkSj rRi'pkr~ 
fuEufyf[kr var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&& 

 

    ßijUrq ;g vkSj fd tu lk/kkj.k dh tkx:drk ds iz;kstu ls vkSj fdlh Hkh 
fnol ds lekjksg bR;kfn ls vk;ksftr fo”ks’k cSBd x.kiwfrZ ds vHkko esa LFkfxr ugha dh 
tk,xhAßA  

 
 5-  /kkjk 5&[k dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5&[k dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ß8 ekpZ dksß 
vad vkSj “kCnksa ds  LFkku ij ßQjojh ds igys jfookj dksß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 6- /kkjk 7&d dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 7&d dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ßAß fpUg ds 
LFkku ij ß%ß fpUg j[kk tk,xk vkSj rRi”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ßijUrq xzke iapk;r dk iz/kku mi&xzke lHkk dh cSBdksa esa fo”ks’k vkeaf=rh ds :i esa 

vkeaf=r fd;k tk,xk rFkk iz/kku mDr cSBd esa Hkkx ys ldsxkAßA 
 
      7-  /kkjk 9 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 9 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßlkoZtfud gksxh 
vkSjß “kCnksa dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA  
 
 8- /kkjk 31 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 31 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 
1973 “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023ß ¼2023 dk 46½ “kCn] fpUg 
vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA   
  
 9-  /kkjk 32 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 32 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa]& 
 



 ¼d½ ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 125ß esa “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; 
ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 144ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axs( 
vkSj  

 

 ¼[k½ ßikap lkS #i;sß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ß,d gtkj #i;sß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA  
 

 10-  /kkjk 33 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 33 esa] ß,d lkS #i;s ls vuf/kdß “kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij ß,d gtkj #i;s rdß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 11-  /kkjk 38 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 38 esa]&& 
  

  ¼d½ [k.M ¼[k½ esa ^^Hkkjrh; n.M lafgrk] 1860 dh /kkjk 379ß ”kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds  
LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 303 ¼2½ß “kCn] 
fpUg] dks’Bd vkSj vad j[ks tk,axs( vkSj 

 
         ¼[k½  [k.M ¼x½ esa ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 109 ;k 110ß “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj 

vadksa ds LFkku ij ^^Hkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 
128 ;k 129ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA  

 
 12-  /kkjk 39 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 39 esa] ßnks lkS #i;sß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij 
ß,d gtkj #i;sß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 13-  /kkjk 40 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 40 esa] ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh èkkjk 
202ß “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 
225ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA  
 
     14- /kkjk 41 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 41 esa]& 
 
 ¼d½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßnks gtkj #i;sß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ßiPphl gtkj #i;sß “kCn j[ks tk,axs( 

vkSj 
 
 ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ßikap gtkj #i;sß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ßipkl gtkj #i;sß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 15- /kkjk 60 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 60 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] ßHkkjrh; lk{; 
vf/kfu;e] 1872 n.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973ß “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ÞHkkjrh; lk{; vf/kfu;e] 
2023 ¼2023 dk 47½ Hkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023ß ¼2023 dk 46½ “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks 
tk,axsA 
 
    16- /kkjk 64 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 64 esa] 
 

 ¼d½ mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 7ß “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij 
ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 dh /kkjk 7ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axs( vkSj 

 

 ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼5½ esa] ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 ds vè;k; 33ß “kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vad ds LFkku  
ij ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ ds v/;k; 34ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad 
j[ks tk,axsA 

 
 17-  /kkjk 76 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 76 esa] ßHkkjrh; n.M lafgrk] 1860 dh èkkjk 
75 ;k n.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 356 ;k 360 “kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; U;k; 
lafgrk] 2023ß ¼2023 dk 45½ dh /kkjk 13 ;k Hkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 
394 ;k 401ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA 



 
    18- /kkjk 99 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 99 esa]& 
 
 ¼d½  mi&/kkjk ¼5½ esa] ßAß fpUg ds LFkku ij ß%ß fpUg j[kk tk,xk vkSj rRi”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr 

var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ßijUrq osru dk lank; djus ds fy, iapk;r lfefr fuf/k ls jde lEc) iapk;r 

lfefr ds lfpo ds gLrk{kjk/khu fudkyh tk,xh] ftlds fy, dk;ksZRrj vuqeksnu lHkk ls 
mldh rqjUr vkxkeh cSBd esa vfHkizkIr fd;k tk,xkA**( vkSj 

 
 ¼[k½  mi&/kkjk ¼6½ esa] ßAß fpUg ds LFkku ij ß%ß fpUg j[kk tk,xk vkSj rRi”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr 

ijUrqd var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ßijUrq osru dk lank; djus ds fy, ftyk ifj’kn~ fuf/k ls jde lEc) ftyk ifj’kn~ 

ds lfpo ds gLrk{kjk/khu fudkyh tk,xh] ftlds fy, dk;ksZRrj vuqeksnu lHkk ls mldh 
rqjUr vkxkeh cSBd esa vfHkizkIr fd;k tk,xkA**A  

  

 19- /kkjk 115 dk izfr%LFkkiu&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 115  ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk 
tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&& 
  

  ^^115- cdk;k dh clwyh-&&¼1½ iapk;r dk lfpo iapk;r }kjk fdlh O;fDr ls nkok djus 
;ksX; fdlh dj] ty nj] fdjk;k] Qhl ;k fdlh vU; jde ds cdk;k dh olwyh gsrq ,sls 
O;fDr dks uksfVl tkjh djds leLr vko';d dne mBk,xkA 

 

 ¼2½  lEc) [k.M fodkl vf/kdkjh] iapk;r lfefr vkSj xzke iapk;r dh ckcr ,sls O;fDr;ksa 
ftuls ,slh jde ns; gS fd lwph lfgr clwyh; jde ds C;kSjs dyDVj dks izLrqr djsxkA 

 
 ¼3½  lEc) eq[; dk;kZdkjh vf/kdkjh ftyk ifj’kn~ dh ckcr ,sls O;fDr;ksa ftuls ,slh jde ns; 

gS dh lwph lfgr clwyh; jde ds C;kSjs dyDVj dks izLrqr djsxkA  
 

 ¼4½ iapk;r }kjk nkok dh xbZ jde Hkw&jktLo ds cdk;k ds :i esa dyDVj }kjk clwy dh tk 
ldsxh% 

 

  ijUrq jkT; ljdkj vkns'k }kjk fgekpy izns'k Hkw&jktLo vfèkfu;e] 1953 ¼1954 dk 
vf/kfu;e la[;kad 6½ ds v/khu fdlh vU; vfèkdkjh dks dyDVj dh 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx 
djus ds fy, fu;qDr dj ldsxhA**A 

 

      20-  /kkjk 120 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 120 esa] mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds i”pkr~ 
fuEufyf[kr vr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr%& 
 

  ß¼4½ ;fn dksbZ iapk;r] jkT; fuokZpu vk;ksx }kjk fuokZpu dk;ZØe tkjh djus ds i”pkr~ 
vifjgk;Z ifjfLFkfr ;k tu& lkèkkj.k }kjk cfg’dkj ;k fdUgha vU; dkj.kksa ls xfBr ugha dh 
tkrh gS rks i”pkr~orhZ xfBr ,slh iapk;r dh vof/k jkT; dh vU; iapk;rksa ds lkFk&lkFk 
jgsxhA**A  

 

 21- /kkjk 121x dk var%LFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 121&[k ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr 
vr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 

 ß121&x- fuokZpu O;; ds ys[ks lkSaius esa vlQy jgus ij fujgZrk-&;fn izkf/k—r vf/kdkjh dk 
lek/kku gks tkrk gS fd dksbZ O;fDr]& 

 

 ¼d½  bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu visf{kr jhfr vkSj le; ds Hkhrj fuokZpu O;; ds ys[ks lkSaius esa 
vlQy gks x;k gS ( ;k 

 



 ¼[k½ mlds }kjk lkSais x, ys[ks fofgr izk:i ds vuqlkj ugha gS ( vkSj 
 

 ¼x½  mlds fy, dksbZ vPNk gsrqd ;k Li’Vhdj.k ugha gS] rks og fuokZpu izR;kf”k;ksa ds ukeksa dks 
ftyk fuokZpu vfèkdkjh dks Hkstsxk] tks jkti= esa izdkf”kr vkns”k }kjk ,sls izR;kf”k;ksa dks 
iapk;r ds fy, pqus tkus vkSj inkf/kdkjh gksus ds fy, ¼jkti=½] esa vkns”k ds izdk”ku dh 
rkjh[k ls rhu o’kZ dh vof/k gsrq fujfgZr ?kksf’kr djsxk vkSj fuokZfpr inkf/kfdkjh ds fuokZpu 
dks “kwU; ?kksf’kr djsxk% 

 

   ijUrq dksbZ ,slk izR;k”kh ,sls vkns”k ds izdk”ku ls rhl fnu dh vof/k ds Hkhrj 
e.Mk;qDr  dks vihy  dj ldsxk vkSj mldk vkns”k vafre gksxkAßA 

 

     22- /kkjk 122 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 122 esa]& 
 

  ¼d½ mi /kkjk ¼1½ esa]& 
 

       ¼i½  [k.M ¼[k[k½  esa] ßvkpj.k dk nks’kh ik;k x;k gS]Þ “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ßtc rd 
fd ,slh rkjh[k ftldks ,sls vkpj.k ds ckjs esa izkf/kdr̀ vf/kdkjh dk fu’d’kZ fn;k 
x;k gS ls ikap o’kZ dh dkykof/k dk volku u gks x;k gksÞ”kCn vUr%LFkkfir fd, 
tk,axs( 

 

       ¼ii½  [k.M ¼?k½ esa ßvijk/k dk nks’kfl) Bgjk;k x;k gSÞ “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ßtc rd 
mldh nks’kflf) ls iakp o’kZ dh dkykofèk dk volku u gks x;k gSAß “kCn 
vr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axs( 

 

       ¼iii½ [k.M ¼³½ esa] ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 110ß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vadksa ds 
LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023ß ¼2023 dk 46½ “kCn] fpUg vkSj 
vad j[ks tk,axs ( 

  

    ¼iv½ [k.M ¼<½ ds ijUrqd dk yksi fd;k tk,xk (  
 

  ¼[k½  mi /kkjk ¼1½ ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xh] vFkkZr%& 
 

  ß¼1&d½ ;fn dksbZ iwoZ inkf/kdkjh] iapk;r ds fdlh /ku ;k fufèk ;k vU; lEifŸk ftl 
esa og ,d i{kdkj jgk gS dh gkfu] nqfoZfu;kstu] nqO;Z;] nq:i;kstu gsrq nks’kh ik;k 
tkrk gS ;k tks vopkj ds ;k mlds drZO;ksa dh ?kksj mis{kk ds dkj.k mlds }kjk gqbZ gS 
tc rd fd mlds in NksM+us ls Ng o’kZ dh vof/k dk volku u gks x;k gks] iapk;r 
dk dksbZ inkf/kdkjh pqus tkus ds fy, fujfgZr gksxk( vkSj  

 
      ¼x½  mi /kkjk ¼2½ esa ß¼1½ß dks’Bd vkSj vad ds i”pkr~ ß;k mi /kkjk ¼1d½ß dks’Bd] v{kj 

vkSj vad var%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
 
    23-  /kkjk 133 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 133 dh mi /kkjk ¼1½ esa ßfuns”kdß “kCn ds 
i”pkr~ ß;k ml }kjk izkf/kd`r dksbZ vU; vf/kdkjhß “kCn var%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
  
    24- /kkjk 134 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 134 esa]& 
 
     ¼d½ mi /kkjk ¼2½ ds [k.M ¼N½ esa ßftyk ifj’kn~ß “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ß;k funs”kdß “kCn var% 

LFkkfir fd, tk,axs(  
 
     ¼[k½  mi /kkjk ¼3½ ds [k.M ¼N½ eas] ßftyk ifj’kn~ß “kCnksa ds i”pkr ß;k funs”kd ;k jkT; 

ljdkj** “kCn var%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
  
 25- /kkjk 142 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 142 esa]& 



 
 ¼d½  mi /kkjk ¼1½ esa ßinkf/kdkjh]ß “kCn vkSj fpUg ds i”pkr~ ßdk;kZy; esa viuh inkof/k ds nkSjku 

iwoZ inkf/kdkjhß “kCn  var%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA  
 
 ¼[k½  mi /kkjk ¼2½ ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&& 
                
  Þ¼3½ ,sls lacaf/kr fu;fer] lafonk] nSfud osruHkksxh] vkmVlkslZ ;k vU; ;kstuk vk/kkfjr 

deZpkfj;ksa tSls dfu"B vfHk;ark] xzke jkstxkj lgk;d] rduhdh lgk;d] ys[kkiky ,oa vU; 
leku dkfeZdksa] tks iapk;rksa rFkk iapk;rh jkt foHkkx }kjk fu;ksftr fd, x;s gSa] dk 
mÙkjnkf;Ro Hkh fu/kkZfjr fd;k tk,xk] ;fn os mUgsa lkSais x, dÙkZO;ksa dk ikyu djus esa 
vlQy jgrs gSa ;k ,sls dÙkZO;ksa dk ikyu lE;d~ rRijrk ls ;k funsZ'kksa ds vuqlkj ugha djrs 
gSaA**A 

 
 26-  /kkjk 144 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 144 dh mi /kkjk ¼3½ ds [k.M ¼[k½ esa] 
ßn.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 ds v/;k; 7 ds micU/kksaß ”kCnksa] fpUg vkSj vdksa ds LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd 
lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ ds v/;k; 7 ds micU/kksaß “kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA  
 
 27-  /kkjk 145 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 145 esa]& 
 
  ¼d½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa]&&  
 
     ¼i½ [k.M ¼d½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZRk~%& 
 
   Þ¼d½ tks nkf.Md vkjksi ;k vU;Fkk ds fy, pkSng fnu ls vf/kd dh vof/k ds fy, 

vfHkj{kk esa jgk gks ;k ftlds fo#) Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ds v/;k; 4] 7] 9]  
10] 13 vkSj v/;k; 5 dh /kkjk 63] 64]  65] 66] 67] 68] 69] 70¼1½] 70¼2½] 71] 80] 88 
ls 94 rd] 99 vkSj v/;k; 6 dh /kkjk 103] 104] 107] 108] 109] 141] 146 vè;k; 17 
vkSj vè;k; 18 dh /kkjk 310¼2½] ¼3½] 311] 312] 316¼4½] ¼5½ 318¼4½] 326¼N½] 331¼6½ 
vkSj ¼8½ rd] vkSj ;k fgekpy çns'k vkcdkjh vf/kfu;e] 2011 ds v/;k; 6 dh /kkjk 
39 ls 59 rd ;k ySafxd vijk/k ls ckydksa dk laj{k.k vfèkfu;e] 2012 ;k Hkz"Vkpkj 
fuokj.k vf/kfu;e] 1988 ds v/khu ;k [kk| lkexzh vkSj vkS"kf/k vifeJ.k ds fuokj.k] 
fL=;ksa rFkk ckydkas ds lEcU/k esa vuSfrd O;kikj neu vkSj flfoy vfèkdkjksa ds laj{k.k 
lEcU/kh rRle; çoÙ̀k fdlh vU; fofèk ds v/khu fdUgha nkf.Md dk;Zokfg;ksa esa vkjksi 
fojfpr fd, x, gaS% 

 
   ijUrq bl [kaM ds v/khu fdlh inkf/kdkjh dks fuyafcr djus ds fy, vkjksi i= ds 

lkFk dkj.k crkvks uksfVl tkjh djus dh vko';drk ugha gksxh vkSj fuyafcr fd;k 
x;k dksbZ Hkh inkf/kdkjh] ftlds fo#) fdlh vkijkf/kd dk;Zokgh esa vkjksi fojfpr 
fd, x, gSa] l{ke U;k;ky; ds vafre fu.kZ; rd fuyafcr jgsxk%  

 
   ijUrq ;g vkSj fd fdlh vkijkf/kd vkjksi ;k vU; dkj.k ls pkSng fnu ls vf/kd 

le; rd fgjklr esa jgus ds ckn fuyafcr fd, x, inkf/kdkjh dk fuyacu jí dj 
fn;k tk,xk ;fn vUos’k.k vfHkdj.k }kjk fgjklr dh rkjh[k ls Ng ekl ds Hkhrj 
l{ke U;k;ky; esa vkjksi i= izLrqr ugha fd;k tkrk gS(ß( vkSj 

 
    ¼ii½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds ijUrqd dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA  
 
  ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼2&d½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 



   Þ¼2&d½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds [kaM ¼x½ ;k mi&/kkjk ¼2½ ds vèkhu fdlh inkf/kdkjh dks rc 
rd fuyafcr ugha fd;k tk,xk tc rd fd mls] ;FkkfLFkfr] vkjksi i= ;k çkjafHkd 
tkap ;k fujh{k.k ;k ys[kk ijh{kk fjiksVZ dh çfr ds lkFk dkj.k crkvks uksfVl tkjh 
djds mls lquokbZ dk volj u ns fn;k tk,Aß(  

 
 ¼x½ mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ßmi&/kkjk ¼1½ ;k ¼2½ß 'kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vad ds LFkku ij ßmi&/kkjk ¼1½ 

dk [k.M ¼x½ mi /kkjk ¼2½ ß'kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[kk tk,xk( vkSj 
 

 ¼?k½ mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr vr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~& 
 

  ß¼3&d½ ,sls ekeyksa esa] ;fn /kkjk 146 ds v/khu tkap Ng ekl ds Hkhrj iwjh ugha gksrh gS] rks 
tkap djus okyk vf/kdkjh lacaf/kr çkfèkdkjh dks fyf[kr esa dkj.k çLrqr djsxk vkSj blds 
vfrfjDr Ng ekl ds fy, ,d ckj foLrkj fn;k tk ldsxkA  

 

  ¼3&[k½ ;fn nsjh fuokZfpr çfrfuf/k dh vksj ls fof/k ds vuqlkj tkap esa vlg;ksx djus ds 
fy, gksrh gS] rks fuyacu vkns'k Ng ekl dh lekfIr ds ckn jí ugha fd;k tk,xk vkSj tkap 
vfèkdkjh fu/kkZfjr vof/k ds Hkhrj ,drjQk tkap ds fy, vkxs c<+sxkA  

 

  ¼3&x½ mä /kkjk dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds v/khu fuyacu ds izfrlagj.k dk vkns'k /kkjk 146 ds 
v/khu tkap dks rc rd çHkkfor ugha djsxk tc rd fd bldk fu"d"kZ fudy ugha tkrk 
gSAßA  

 

 ¼³½  mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] fpUg ßAß] ds LFkku ij ß%ß fpUg j[kk tk,xk vkSj rRi'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr 
var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~& 

 

   ßijUrq ;fn iapk;rksa ds fuokZfpr inkf/kdkfj;ksa dks bl lhek rd fuyafcr dj fn;k 
tk, fd 'ks"k fuokZfpr inkf/kdkfj;ksa dh la[;k iapk;r dh cSBd cqykus ds fy, visf{kr 
x.kiwfrZ iwjh ugha djrs gSa] rks jkT; ljdkj ;k ,slk çkf/kdkjh tSlk fofgr fd;k tk, lacaf/kr 
xzke lHkk dh flQkfj'kksa ij] ,slh lfefr ds çeq[k lfgr O;fä;ksa dh ,d lfefr xfBr dj 
ldsxk] tks ,sls fuyafcr inkfèkdkfj;ksa ij vafre fu.kZ; yafcr jgus rd iapk;r dh 'kfä;ksa 
dk ç;ksx] dÙkZO;ksa dk ikyu vkSj dk;ksaZ dk fuoZgu djsxhAßA 

 
 28- /kkjk 151 dk izfrLFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 151 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk 
tk,xk] vFkkZr%& 
 
  ß151- fdlh lnL; inkf/kdkjh ;k lsod }kjk lafonk esa fgr vftZr djus ds fy,      

“kkfLr-&&;fn ipak;r dk dksbZ lnL; ;k inkf/kdkjh ;k lsod] iapk;r ds lkFk ;k ml ds 
}kjk ;k mldh vksj ls dh xbZ lafonk ;k fd, x, fdlh fu;kstu esa izR;{kr% ;k vizR;{kr% 
dksbZ oS;fDrd va”k ;k fgr] tkurs gq, vftZr djrk gS rks ml ds ckjs esa ;g le>k tk,xk 
fd mlus Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 45½ dh /kkjk 202 ds v/khu vijk/k fd;k gSA 

 
 Li’Vhdj.k-&&bl /kkjk ds iz;kstuksa ds fy, ßiapk;r ds lsodß ds vUrxZr leLr lfEefyr gSa tks 
iapk;r dk fu;qfDr izkf/kdkjh  vkSj muds ikfjJfed ds L=ksr dks fopkj esa yk, fcuk iapk;r esa lsokjr 
gSAßA  
 
 29- /kkjk 152 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 152 esa] ßHkkjrh; naM lafgrk] 1860  dh /kkjk 
341Þ 'kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij] ßHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ¼2023 dk 45½ dh /kkjk 126 ¼2½ß 
'kCn] fpUg] vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 30- /kkjk 155 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 155 esa fo|eku micU/k dks ¼1½ ds :i esa 
la[;kafdr fd;k tk,xk vkSj] rRi”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 



 
 ß¼2½ ;fn dksbZ O;fä] fdlh çfof"V ds fdlh fuokZpd ukekoyh esa lfEefyr ;k mlesa 

vioftZr fd, tkus ds lac/k esa fyf[kr :i esa dksbZ dFku ;k ?kks’k.kk djrk gS tks feF;k gS 
vkSj ftlds feF;k gksus dk ;k rks mls Kku gS ;k fo'okl gS ;k ftlds lR; gksus dk mls 
fo”okl ugha gS rks og tqekZus ls] tks ikap gtkj :i, rd gks ldsxk] nf.Mr fd;k 
tk,xkAßA 

 
    31- /kkjk 158&n dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 158&n esa]& 
 
     ¼d½  'kh"kZd esa] ßernku ds fnuß 'kCnksa ds i'pkr~ ßvkSj x.kuk ds fnuß 'kCn vr%LFkkfir fd, 

tk,axs( vkSj  
 
     ¼[k½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ßernku {ks= esaß 'kCnksa ds i'pkr~ ßvkSj erx.kuk ds fnuß 'kCn 

vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
 

    32-  /kkjk 160 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 160 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds vUr esa] ßAß fpUg 
ds LFkku ß%ß fpUg j[kk tk,xk vkSj mlds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr  var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 

   ßijUrq dsoy ,sls O;fä ij jkT; fuokZpu vk;qä ds :i esa fu;qfä ds fy, fopkj fd;k 
tk,xk] ftlus dsUæ ;k jkT; ljdkj esa xzqi&, ;k Js.kh&I ds in ij chl o"kZ rd dk;Z 
fd;k gks vkSj mls fuokZpu ¼fuokZpukas½ ds lapkyu dk vuqHko gks rFkk mlds fo#) dksbZ 
lrdZrk ;k foHkkxh; ekeyk yafcr u gks% 

 

   ijUrq ;g vkSj fd fu;qfä djus ls iwoZ lrdZrk vukifÙk çek.k&i= Hkh çkIr fd;k 
tk,xkAßA 

 

      33-  /kkjk 160&d dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 160&d esa] ßjkT; ljdkjß 'kCn tgka 
dgha vkrs gSa ds LFkku ij ßftyk fuokZpu vf/kdkjhß 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 34- /kkjk 161 dk la'kks/ku-&& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 161 ds [k.M ¼iii½ esa] ßvk;qDrß 'kCn ds 
LFkku ij ße.Myk;qDrß 'kCn j[kk tk,xkA 
 

 35- /kkjk 167 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 167 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ßHkkjrh; lk{; 
vf/kfu;e] 1872** 'kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ßHkkjrh; lk{; vf/kfu;e] 2023** ¼2023 dk 47½ 'kCn] 
fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 36-  /kkjk 169 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 169 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ßn.M çfØ;k 
lafgrk] 1973 dh /kkjk 345 vkSj 346ß 'kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ßHkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 
2023 ¼2023 dk 46½ dh /kkjk 384 vkSj 385ß 'kCn] fpUg vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 37- /kkjk 172 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 172 esa] ÞHkkjrh; n.M lafgrk] 1860 ds 
v/;k; 9&dß 'kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ij ÞHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 ds v/;k; 9ß 'kCn] fpUg 
vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 38- /kkjk 186 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 186 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ßlHkh fu;eß 'kCnksa 
ds i'pkr~ ßvf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 135 ds v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds flok,Þ 'kCn var%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
 

 39- /kkjk 190 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 190 esa] ßHkkjrh; n.M lafgrk] 1860 dh /kkjk 
21 ds vFkZÞ 'kCnksa] fpUgksa vkSj vadksa ds LFkku ßHkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk 2023 ds /kkjk 2¼28½ds vFkZß 'kCn] fpUg 
vkSj vad j[ks tk,axsA 
 



 40-  vuqlwph &3 dk izfrLFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e ls layXu vuqlwph&3 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr 
j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 

^^vuqlwph&3  
¼/kkjk 32 ns[ksa½ 

 

xzke iapk;r }kjk laKs; vijk/k 
 

la[;k vf/kfu;e ;k lafgrk dk uke vijk/k /kkjk 

1. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023       LosPN;k migfr dkfjr djukA 115 
2. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023        izdksiu ij LosPNk migfr djukA 122 (1) 
3. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      lnks"k vojks/kA 126 
4. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      xaHkhj izdksiu gksus ls vU;Fkk geyk djus ;k vkijkfèkd 

cy dk iz;ksx djus ds fy, n.MA 
131 

5. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 naxkA 194 
6. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 leuksa dh rkehy ;k vU; dk;Zokgh ls cpus ds fy, 

Qjkj gks tkukA 
206 

7. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 2023 leu dh rkehy dk ;k vU; dk;Zokgh dk ;k mlds 
izdk'ku dk fuokj.k djukA 

207 

8. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 'kiFk ;k izfrKku ls bUdkj djuk] tcfd yksd lsod 
}kjk og oSlk djus ds fy, lE;d :i ls visf{kr fd;k 
tk,A 

213 

9. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      iz'u djus ds fy, izkf/k—r yksd lsod dks mÙkj nsus ls 
bUdkj djukA 

214 

10. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 dFku ij gLrk{kj djus ls bUdkj djukA 215 
11. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      U;kf;d dk;Zokgh esa cSBs gq, yksd lsod dk lk'k; 

vieku ;k mlds dk;Z esa fo?uA 
267 

12. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 mis{kkiw.kZ dk;Z ftlls thou ds fy, ladViw.kZ jksx dk 
laØe.k QSyuk lEHkkO; gksA 

271 

13. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 yksd ty&L=ksr ;k tyk'k; dk ty dyqf"kr djukA 279 
14. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      yksd ekxZ ;k ukS ifjogu iFk esa ladV ;k ck/kkA 285 
15. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 vfXu ;k Toyu'khy inkFkZ ds lEcU/k esa mis{kkiw.kZ 

vkpj.kA 
287 

16. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      foLQksVd inkFkZ ds ckjs esa mis{kkiw.kZ vkpj.kA 288 
17. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      fdlh fuekZ.k dks fxjkus] mldh eqjEer djus ;k lafuekZ.k 

djus ds lEcU/k esa mis{kkiw.kZ vkpj.kA 
290 

18. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 tho&tUrq ds lEcU/k esa mis{kkiw.kZ vkpj.kA 291 
19. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      vU;Fkk vuqicfU/kr ekeyksa esa yksd U;wlsUl ds fy, n.M 292 
20. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023       v'yhy dk;Z vkSj xkusA 296 
21. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023        vkijkf/kd U;k;HkaxA 316 ¼1vkSj 2½ 

22. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023      pqjkbZ gqbZ lEifÙkA 317 ¼1vkSj 2½ 

23. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023    NyA 318 ¼1vkSj 2½ 

24. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 fjf"V ¼uqdlku ;k gkfu 1]000 #i;s ds ewY; rd gksaA 324 ¼1vkSj 5½ 

25. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 tho&tUrq dk o/k djus ;k mls fodykax djus }kjk 

fjf"VA ¼1]000 #i;s ds ewY; rd½A 

325 

26. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023  vkijkf/kd vfrpkj vkSj xg̀&vfrpkjA  329 

27. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 yksd'kkfUr Hkax djkus dks izdksfir djus ds vk'k; ls 

lk'k; viekuA 

352 

28. Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk]  2023 er O;fDr }kjk yksd LFkku esa vopkjA 355 

29. Vhdk vf/kfu;e]1880 ¼1880 
dk 13½ 

/kkjk 22 ds [k.M ¼d½ ¼[k½ vkSj ¼?k½ ds vUrxZr vkus okys 
vijk/kksa dk n.M 

/kkjk 22 ds [k.M 
¼x½ ds flok;A 



30. i'kq vfrpkj vf/kfu;e] 1871 i'kqvksa ds vfHkxzg.k dk cyiowZd fojks/k djuk vFkok mUgsa 
NqM+kukA 

24 

31. i'kq vfrpkj vf/kfu;e] 1871 lqvjksa }kjk Hkwfe ;k Qlyksa vkSj lkoZtfud lM+dksa dks 
uqDlku igqapk;k tkukA 

26 

32. fgekpy çns'k fd'kksj ¼/kweziku 
fu"ksèk½ vf/kfu;e] 1952 

ckydksa dks rEckdw cspus ds fy, 'kkfLrA 3 

33. fgekpy çns'k fd'kksj ¼/kweziku 
fu"ksèk½ vf/kfu;e] 1952 

lkoZtfud LFkku esa fd'kksj ls rEckdw dk vfHkxzg.k 
djukA 

4 

34. lkoZtfud |wr vf/kfu;e] 
1867 ¼1867 dk 2½ 

tqvk ?kj dk Lokeh gksus ;k mls pykus ;k Hkkj  
lkèkd gksus ds fy, 'kkfLrA 

3 

35. lkoZtfud |wr ¼ifCyd 
xScfyax½vf/kfu;e] 1867 
¼1867 dk 2½ 

tqvk?kj esa ik, tkus ds fy, 'kkfLrA 4 

36. lkoZtfud |wr ¼ifCyd 
xScfyax½vf/kfu;e] 1867 
¼1867 dk 2½ 

fxj¶rkj O;fDr;ksa ij xyr uke vkSj irk nsus ds fy, 
'kkfLrA 

7 

37. lkoZtfud |wr vf/kfu;e] 
1867 ¼1867 dk 2½ 

bl vf/kfue; dh /kkjk 22] 158 vkSj 187 ds v/khu 
vijk/kA 

 

 
mís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku 

 

 fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 esa blds micU/kksa dks fuorZeku fof/kd vkSj 
iz'kklfud lq/kkjksa ds lkFk ,d:irk ykus gsrq la'kksf/kr fd, tkus dh vko';drk gSA Hkkjrh; U;k; lafgrk] 
2023 Hkkjrh; ukxfjd lqj{kk lafgrk] 2023 vkSj Hkkjrh; lk{; vf/kfu;e] 2023 ds vfèkfu;fer gksus ls 
fujflr Hkkjrh; n.M lafgrk] 1860] n.M izfØ;k lafgrk] 1973 vkSj Hkkjrh; lk{; vf/kfu;e] 1872 ds 
lanHkksZa dk izfrLFkkfir djuk vfuok;Z gks x;k gSA 
 

 ;g fo/ks;d fuokZpu ukekoyh] fuokZpu O;;ksa] vgZrkvksa] fujgrkZvksa vkSj fuokZpuksa ds Lo:i ls 
lEcfU/kr micU/kksa lfgr yksd izfrfuf/kRo vf/kfu;e] 1951 dh rtZ ij pquko lq/kkjksa dks iqj%LFkkfir djus 
dks izLrko djrk gSA ;g iapk;rksa ds dk;Zdykiksa dks muds dk;Zdky] fuyEcu] ns;ksa dh olwyh dh ckcr 
'kkfLr;ksa vkSj vf/kdkfjrk ewY;ksa esa o`f) djus] foÙkh; izfØ;kvksa dks lqO;ofLFkr djus vkSj iz'kklfud 
Li"Vrk iznku djus ds }kjk lqn`<+hdj.k djus ij Hkh yf{kr gSA 
 

 izLrkfor la'kks/ku ubZ vkijkf/kd fof/k;ksa esa ,d:irk lqfuf'pr djus] pqukoh izfØ;k dks iVjh ij 
ykus] laLFkkxr dk;Zdykiksa esa lq/kkj djus] izfØ;kvksa dh ljyhdj.k vkSj inkf/kdkfj;ksa dk mÙkjnkf;Ro 
c<+kus gsrq vk'kf;r gSA 
 

 ;g fo/k;sd mi;qZDr mn~ns';ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gSA 
 

 ¼vfu:) flag½ 
 izHkkjh eU=hA 

f”keyk% 
rkjh[k---------------------] 2025 
 

&&&&&&&&& 
 

foRrh; Kkiu 
 

&”kwU;& 
 

&&&&&&& 
 



izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu 
 

&”kwU;& 
 

&&&&&&& 
fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2025 

 
 fgekpy izns'k iapk;rh jkt vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 4½ dk vkSj la'kksèku 
djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA 
 

¼vfu:) flag½ 
izHkkjh eU=hA 

&&&&&&&&& 
 
¼'kjn dqekj yxoky½ 
  lfpo ¼fof/k½A 
 
 
 
 
f'keyk % 
rkjh[k% ---------------------------] 2025 
 
 

&&&&&&&&& 
 
 
 

AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT 
 

 Bill No. 19 of  2025. 
 

 
THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  PANCHAYATI  RAJ  (AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2025 

 
ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES 

 
Clauses: 
 
 1. Short title. 
 2. Amendment of section  2. 
 3. Amendment of section 4. 
 4. Amendment of section 5. 
 5. Amendment of section 5-B. 
 6. Amendment of section 7-A. 
 7. Amendment of section 9. 
 8. Amendment of section 31. 
 9. Amendment of section 32. 
 10. Amendment of section 33. 
 11. Amendment of section 38. 



 12. Amendment of section 39. 
 13. Amendment of section  40. 
 14. Amendment of section 41. 
 15. Amendment of section 60. 
 16. Amendment of section 64. 
 17. Amendment of section 76. 
 18. Amendment of section 99. 
 19. Substitution of section 115. 
 20. Amendment of section 120. 
 21. Insertion of section  121-C. 
 22. Amendment of section 122. 
 23. Amendment of section 133. 
 24. Amendment of section 134. 
 25. Amendment of section 142. 
 26. Amendment of section 144. 
 27. Amendment of section 145. 
 28. Substitution of section 151. 
 29. Amendment of section 152. 
 30. Amendment of section 155. 
 31. Amendment of section 158-R. 
 32. Amendment of section 160. 
 33. Amendment of section 160-A. 
 34. Amendment of section 161. 
 35. Amendment of section 167. 
 36. Amendment of section 169. 
 37. Amendment of section 172. 
 38. Amendment of section 186. 
 39. Amendment of section 190. 
 40. Substitution of  SCHEDULE –III. 
 
 

____________ 
Bill No. 19 of  2025 

 
 

THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  PANCHAYATI  RAJ (AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2025 
 

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY) 
 

A 
 

BILL 
 
 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (Act No. 4 of 1994). 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year 
of the Republic of India as follows:— 
 
 1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj 
(Amendment) Act, 2025.  
 
 2. Amendment of section  2.—In section 2 of the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 
1994 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),— 
 



  (a) in clause (22), for the words, signs and figures  “ section 2 of the Code of 
Criminal Procedure, 1973”, the words, sign and figures  “section 2 of  the 
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023(46 of 2023)” shall be substituted; and   

 
  (b) in clause  (35), for the words, signs and figures “section 21 of the Indian Penal 

Code, 1860 ” ,  the words, signs and figures “section 2 (28) of the Bhartiya Nyaya 
Sanhita, 2023(45 of 2023)” shall be substituted  . 

 
 3. Amendment of section  4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the 
following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
  “(4)   If any person makes in connection with,— 
 
   (a) the preparation, revision or correction of an electoral roll; or  
 
   (b) the inclusion or exclusion of any entry in or from an electoral  roll,  
     
  a statement or declaration in writing which is false and which he either knows or 

believes to be false or does not believe to be true, he shall be punished as per section 
155.”. 

 
 4. Amendment of section  5.—In section 5 of the principal Act,—  
 
  (a) in sub-section (1), 
 

   (i)  in second proviso,— 
 

     (A) after the words “Deputy Commissioner”,  the words   “or the Director” 
shall be inserted;  

 
    (B) for the figures “30” and for the words “an extra-ordinary general 

meeting”,  the words “three” and “a special meeting” shall be 
substituted respectively; and  

 
   (ii) in third proviso for the word “thirty”,  the word “seven” shall be substituted; 
 
  (b)  in sub-section (3),- 
 
   (i)  after the word “general”, the words “or a special” shall be inserted; and  
 
   (ii)  in the end of the  proviso for the sign“.” the  sign “:” shall be substituted and 

thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
          
      “Provided further that a special meeting organised for the purpose of 

awareness of general public and celebration of any day etc., shall not be 
adjourned for want of quorum.”.  

 
 5. Amendment of section  5-B.—In section 5-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the figure and words “8th March”, the words “first Sunday of February” shall be substituted. 
 
 6. Amendment of section  7-A.—In section 7-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), 
for the sign “.” the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following shall be inserted, 
namely:— 
 



   “Provided that the Pradhan of the Gram Panchayat should be invited as a special 
invitee in the meetings of  Up-Gram Sabha and the Pradhan may attend the said 
meetings.”.  

 
 7. Amendment of section  9.—In section 9 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the 
words “shall be public and” shall be omitted. 
 
 8. Amendment of section  31.—In section 31 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for 
the words, signs and figures “the Criminal Procedure Code, 1973”, the words, sign and figures “the 
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)” shall be substituted.  
 
 9. Amendment of section  32.—In section 32 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),— 
 
  (a) for the words, signs and figures “section 125 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 

1973”, the words, sign and figures  “section 144 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha 
Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) ”  shall be substituted; and 

 
  (b) for the words “five hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted. 
 
 10. Amendment of section  33.—In section 33 of the principal Act, for the words “ not 
exceeding one hundred”, the words “which may extend to one thousand” shall be substituted. 
 
 11. Amendment of section  38.—In section 38 of the principal Act,— 
 
  (a)  in clause (b), for the words, signs and figures “section 379 of the Indian Penal 

Code”,  the words, signs and figures “section 303(2) of the Bharatiya Nyaya 
Sanhita , 2023 (45 of 2023) ”  shall be substituted; and  

 
  (b)  in clause (c),  for the words, signs  and figures “sections 109 or 110 of the Code of  

Criminal  Procedure,  1973 ”,  the words, signs and figures “sections 128 or 129 
of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023(46 of 2023)” shall be substituted. 

 
 12. Amendment of section  39.—In section 39 of the principal Act, for the words “two 
hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted. 
 
 13. Amendment of section  40.—In section 40 of the principal Act,   for the words, signs 
and figures “section 202 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973”, the words, sign  and figures 
“section 225 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 203) ”  shall be substituted. 
 
 14. Amendment of section  41.—In section 41 of the principal Act,—  
 
  (a) in sub-section (1), for the words “two thousand”, the words “twenty five 

thousand” shall be substituted; and 
 
  (b) in sub-section (2), for the words “five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand” shall 

be substituted. 
 
 15. Amendment of section  60.—In section 60 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), for 
the words, signs  and figures “the Indian Evidence Act, 1872, the Code of Criminal Procedure, 
1973”, the words, signs and figures “ the Bhartiya Sakshya Adhiniyam, 2023 (47 of 2023), the 
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023) ”  shall be substituted. 
 



 16. Amendment of section  64.—In section 64 of the principal Act,— 
  
  (a)  in sub-section (2), for the words,  sign and figures “section 7 of the Code of 

Criminal Procedure, 1973” , the words, sign and figures “section 7 of  the 
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)”  shall be substituted ; and 

 
  (b)  in sub-section (5), for the words, number, sign and figures “Chapter XXXIII of 

the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 ” , the words, number, sign and figures   
“Chapter XXXIV of  the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) 
shall be substituted. 

 
 17. Amendment of section  76.—In section 76 of the principal Act, for the words, signs  
and figures “section 75 of  the Indian Penal Code, 1860   or   section 356  or  360  of  Code  of  
Criminal  Procedure,  1973 ”,  the words,  sign  and  figures “section 13 of the Bhartiya Nyaya 
Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) ”  or sections 394  or 401 of  the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 
2023 (46 of 2023) ”  shall be substituted.   
 
 18. Amendment of section  99.—In section 99 of the principal Act,—  
 
  (a) in sub-section (5), for the sign “.”, the sign “ : ” shall be substituted and thereafter 

the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
    “Provided that  for making the payment of salary,  the amount from the Panchayat 

Samiti Fund may be withdrawn under the signature of the Secretary of the 
concerned Panchayat Samiti,  for which ex-post facto approval shall be obtained 
from the House in its immediate next meeting.”; and 

 
  (b)  in sub-section (6), for the sign “.”, the sign “ : ”  shall be substituted and thereafter 

the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
    “Provided that for making the payment of salary, the amount from the Zila 

Parishad fund may be withdrawn under the signature of the Secretary of the 
concerned Zila Parishad, for which ex-post facto approval shall be obtained from 
the House in its immediate next meeting.”.  

 
 19. Amendment of section  115.—For section 115 of the principal Act, the following shall 
be substituted, namely:— 
 
  “115. Recovery of arrears.—(1) The Secretary of the Panchayat shall take all 

necessary steps for the recovery of arrears of any tax, water rate, rent, fee, or any other 
sum claimable by the Panchayat from any person, by issuing a notice of recovery to 
such person. 

 
  (2)  The Block Development Officer concerned shall furnish to the Collector the details 

of the amount recoverable, along with a list of persons from whom such amount is due, 
in respect of the Panchayat Samiti and the Gram Panchayat. 

 
  (3)  The Chief Executive Officer concerned shall furnish to the Collector the details of 

the amount recoverable, along with a list of persons from whom such amount is due, in 
respect of the Zila Parishad. 

 



  (4) The amount claimable by a Panchayat may be recovered by the Collector as an 
arrear of land revenue: 

 
   Provided that the State Government may, by order, appoint any other officer to 

exercise the powers of the Collector under the Himachal Pradesh Land Revenue Act, 
1953 (6 of 1954).”. 

 
 20. Amendment of section  120.—In section 120 of the principal Act, after sub-section 
(3), the following  shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
  “(4)  If a Panchayat is not constituted due to force-majeure conditions or boycott by 

general public or due to some other reasons after the issue of election programme by 
the State Election Commission, the term of such Panchayat constituted later on shall 
run concurrently with other Panchayats of the State.”. 

 
 21. Insertion of section  121-C.—After section 121-B of the principal Act, following shall 
be inserted, namely:— 
 
  “121-C. Disqualification for failure to lodge account of election expenses.—If the 

authorised officer is satisfied that,— 
 
  (a)   the candidate has failed to lodge an account of election expenses within the time   

and in the manner required by or under this Act; or 
 
  (b)  the account lodged by the candidate are not in accordance with prescribed format, 

and  
 
  (c)  the candidate has no good reason or justification for the failure mentioned in 

clause (a) or (b), above, 
 
  he shall, forward  the names of such contesting candidates to the District Election 

Officer, who shall by order published in the Gazette, declare such candidates 
disqualified for being chosen as, and for being office bearer, of a Panchayat for a 
period of three years from the date of publication of the order in the Gazette and 
declare the election of the elected office bearer to be void: 

 
   Provided that any such candidate may file an appeal to the Divisional Commissioner 

within a period of 30 days from the publication of such order and his order shall be 
final.”. 

 
 22. Amendment of section  122.—In section 122 of the principal Act,—  
 
  (a) in sub-section (1),— 
 
   (i) in clause  (bb), after the words  “section 180 of this Act”, the words “unless a 

period of six years has elapsed from the date on which the finding of the 
authorised officer as to such practice has been given” shall be inserted; 

 
   (ii) in clause  (d), after the words  “for the time being in force”, the   words 

“unless a period of six years has elapsed since his conviction” shall be 
inserted; 

 



   (iii) in clause (e), for the words,  sign and figures “section 110 of the   Code of 
Criminal Procedure, 1973 ”, the words, sign and figures  “section 129 of  the 
Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 46 of 2023) ”  shall be substituted; 
and 

 
   (iv) the proviso to clause (n) shall be omitted; 
  (b)  after sub-section (1), the following  shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
   “(1-A) If an Ex-Office bearer is found guilty for loss,  misappropriation, waste, or 

misapplication of any money or fund or other property of the Panchayat to which 
he has been a party, or which has been caused by him by misconduct or gross 
negligence of his duties unless a period of six years has elapsed since his 
demitting the office, shall be disqualified for being chosen as an office bearer of a 
Panchayat.”; and   

 
  (c)  in sub-section (2), after  sign  and  figure  “(1)”,  the  words, signs,  and  figure  

“or sub-section (1-A)” shall be inserted.  
 
 23. Amendment of section  133.—In section 133 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),  
after the word “Director”,  the words “or any other officer authorised by him” shall be inserted.  
 
 24. Amendment of section  134.—In section 134 of the principal,—  
 
  (a)  in sub-section 2, in clause (g), after the words “Zila Parishad”, the words “or the 

Director” shall be inserted; and  
 
  (b)  in sub-section 3, in clause (g), after the words “Zila Parishad”, the words “or the 

Director or the State Government” shall be inserted. 
 
 25. Amendment of section  142.—In section 142 of the principal Act,- 
 
  (a) in sub-section (1), after the words and sign “office bearer,”, the words and sign 

“Ex-office bearer during his tenure in the office” shall be inserted; and 
 

  (b) after sub-section (2), the following  shall be inserted, namely:— 
 

   “(3)  The responsibility of concerned regular, contractual, daily wage, outsourced 
or other scheme based employees like Junior Engineers, Gram Rojgar Sahayaks, 
Technical Assistants, Accountants and  other similar workers engaged by the 
Panchayats and the Panchayati Raj  Department  shall also be fixed, in case they 
fail to perform the duties assigned to them or do not perform such duties with due 
diligence or in accordance with the instructions. 

 
 26. Amendment of section  144.—In section 144 of the principal Act, in sub-section 3, in 
clause (b),  for the words,  signs and figures “Provisions of Chapter VII of the Code of Criminal 
Procedure, 1973”,  the words, signs, and figures   “provisions of Chapter VII of the Bhartiya 
Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (46 of 2023)” shall be substituted. 
 
 27. Amendment of section  145.—In section 145 of the principal Act,—  
 
    (a)   in sub-section (1),—  
 
   (i)  for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 



    “(a) who remained in custody for more than fourteen days on a criminal 
charge or otherwise or against whom charges have  been framed in any  
criminal proceedings under chapter IV, VII, IX, X, XIII,  sections 63, 64, 65, 
66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 80, 88 to 94, 99 of chapter V, sections 103,104, 107, 
108, 109,  141, 146 of chapter VI, sections  310(2) and (3), 311, 312, 316(4) 
and (5), 318(4), 326 (g), 331(6) and (8)  of  Chapter XVII and Chapter XVIII 
of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023  or sections 39 to 59 of Chapter-VI of 
the Himachal Pradesh Excise Act, 2011 (33 of 2012) or the Protection of 
Children from Sexual Offences Act, 2012 (32 of 2012) or the Prevention of 
Corruption Act, 1988 (49 of 1988) or any other law for the time being in 
force for the prevention of adulteration of food stuff and drugs, suppression 
of immoral traffic in women and children and protection of civil rights: 

 
    Provided that for suspending any office bearer under this clause there shall be no 

requirement to issue show cause notice along with chargesheet and any office 
bearer, placed under suspension against whom charges have been framed in any 
criminal  proceedings shall remain under suspension, till the final decision of the 
competent court : 

 
                 Provided further that the suspension of an office bearer placed under suspension 

after remaining in custody for more than fourteen days on a criminal charge or 
otherwise shall be revoked, if chargesheet is not produced by the investigating 
agencies in the competent court within six  months from the date of custody;”;  
and  

 
   (ii) the proviso to sub-section (1) shall be deleted. 
 
  (b)  for sub-section (2-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—  
 
   “(2-A) No office bearer shall be placed under suspension under clause (c) of sub-

section (1) or sub-section (2) unless he has been given an opportunity of being 
heard by issuing a show cause notice along with a copy of chargesheet or 
preliminary inquiry or inspection or audit report, as the case may be.”; 

 
  (c)   in sub-section (3), for the words, signs and figures “sub-section (1) or (2)”, the 

words, signs and figures “clause (c) of sub-section (1) or sub-section (2)” shall be 
substituted; and 

 
  (d)  after sub-section (3), the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
   “(3-A)  In cases, where inquiry under section 146 is not completed within six 

months, the officer holding inquiry shall furnish reasons in writing to concerned 
authority and further, one time extension for six month may be given.  

 
   (3-B) Where the delay is on the part of the elected representative for non-

cooperation in the inquiry in accordance with law, the suspension order shall not 
be revoked after expiry of six months  and the inquiry officer shall further proceed 
for ex-parte inquiry within stipulated period.  

 
   (3-C) The order of revocation of suspension under sub-section (3) of said section 

shall not affect the inquiry under section 146 until it is concluded.”. 
 



  (e)   in sub-section (4), for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter 
the following shall be inserted, namely:— 

 
    “Provided that in case the elected office bearers of  a Panchayat are suspended to 

the extent that the number of remaining elected office bearers do not fulfill the 
quorum required for convening a meeting of the Panchayat, then the State 
Government or the authority as may be prescribed, may constitute a committee of 
persons along with head of such committee on the recommendations of Gram 
Sabha concerned, to exercise the powers, perform the duties and discharge the 
functions of the Panchayat until the final decision  is pending on such suspended 
office bearers.”. 

 
 28. Substitution of section  151.—For  section 151 of the principal Act, the following 
shall be substituted, namely:- 
 
  “151. Penalty for acquisition by a member, office bearer or servant of interest in 

contracts.—If a member or office bearer or servant of Panchayat knowingly acquires, 
directly or indirectly any personal share or interest in any contract or employment with, 
by or on behalf of a Panchayat, he shall be deemed to have committed an offence 
under section  202 of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023). 

 
  “Explanation:—For the purposes of this  section  “servant of panchayat” shall include 

all the employee  who are serving in Panchayats irrespective of appointing authority 
not being the Panchayat and irrespective of the source of their remuneration.”. 

 
 29. Amendment of section  152.—In section 152 of the principal Act, for the words, signs  
and figures  “section 341 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860”, the words, signs and figures “section 
126 (2) of the  Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) ”  shall be substituted. 
 
 30. Amendment of section  155.—In section 155 of the principal Act, the existing 
provision shall be numbered as (1) and thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
  “(2)  If any person makes in connection with, the inclusion or exclusion of any entry in 

or from an electoral  roll, a statement or declaration in writing which is false and which 
he either knows or believes to be false or does not believe to be true, he shall be 
punished with fine of  five thousand rupees.”.  

 
 31. Amendment of section  158-R.—In section 158-R of the principal Act,— 
 
  (a) in heading, after the words  “distributed on Polling day”, the words “and counting 

day” shall be inserted; and 
 
  (b)  in sub-section (1), after the words “ in that polling area”,  the words “and  on the 

day of counting” shall be inserted.    
 
 32. Amendment of section  160.—In section 160 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
at the end for the sign  “.”  the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following  shall be 
inserted, namely:— 
 
   “Provided that only such person shall be considered for appointment as State Election 

Commissioner who has worked for twenty years in a  Group-A or Class-I post in the 



Central or State Government with experience of conducting elections and there is no 
vigilance or departmental case pending against him:  

 
   Provided further that the Vigilance Clearance Certificate shall also be obtained before 

making appointment.”. 
 
 33. Amendment of section  160-A.—In section 160-A of the principal Act, for the words 
“State Government”, wherever occurs the words “District Election Officer” shall be substituted. 
 
 34. Amendment of section  161.—In section 161, in clause (iii), for the word 
“Commissioner”, the words “Divisional Commissioner” shall be substituted. 
 
 35. Amendment of section  167.—In section 167 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),  
for the words, signs and figures “Indian Evidence Act, 1872”, the words, sign and figures  
“Bhartiya Sakshya Adhiniyam , 2023 (47 of 2023) ”   shall be substituted.  
 
 36. Amendment of section  169.—In section 169 of the principal act, for  the words, signs 
and figures “sections 345 and 346 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 ” , the words, signs and 
figures “sections 384 and 385 of the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023” (46 of 2023) shall 
be substituted.  
 
 37. Amendment of section  172.—In section 172 of the principal Act, for  the words, 
signs and figures “Chapter IX-A the Indian Penal Code, 1860” , the words, signs and figures  
“Chapter IX of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023)”  shall be substituted. 
 
 38. Amendment of section  186.—In section 186 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), 
after the words “All rules”, the words “ except the rules framed under section 135(2)”, shall be 
inserted. 
 
 39. Amendment of section  190.—In section 190 of the principal Act, for  the words, 
signs, and figure, “the meaning of section 21 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860”,  the words, signs  
and figures  “the meaning of section 2(28) of the Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (45 of 2023) ”  
shall be substituted. 
 
 

40. Substitution of SCHEDULE-III.—For SCHEDULE-III appended to the principle 
Act, the following shall be substituted, namely:— 

 
“SCHEDULE-III  
(See section 32) 

 
OFFENCES  COGNIZABLE  BY  A  GRAM  PANCHAYAT 

 
No. 
1 

Nane of Act/Code 
2 

Offence 
3 

Section 
4 

1. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023   

Voluntarily causing hurt  115 

2. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Voluntarily causing hurt on provocation 122(1) 
3. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Wrongful restraint 126 
4. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Punishment for assault or criminal force otherwise 
than on grave provocation. 

131 



5. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Affray 194 
6. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Absconding to avoid service of summons or other 
proceedings. 

206 

7. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Preventing service  of summons or other 
proceedings, or preventing publication thereof. 

207 

8. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Refusing oath or affirmation when duly required 
by a public servant to make it. 

213 

9. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Refusing to answer a public servant authorised to 
question. 

214 

10. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Refusing to sign statement. 215 
11. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Intentional insult or interruption to  public servant 
sitting in judicial proceeding. 

267 

12. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Negligent act likely to spread infection of disease 
dangerous life. 

271 

13. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Fouling the water or public spring or reservoir. 279 
14. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Danger of obstruction in public way or line of 
navigation. 

285 

15. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Negligent conduct  with respect  to fire or 
combustible matter. 

287 

16. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Negligent conduct with respect to explosive 
substance. 

288 

17. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Negligent conduct with respect to pulling down,  
repairing as contructing buildings, etc. 

290 

18. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Negligent conduct with respect to  animal 291 
19. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Pubishment for public nuisance in cases not 
otherwise provided for 

292 

20. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Obscene acts and songs 296 
21. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Criminal breach of trust 316 (1) and (2) 
22. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Stolen property 317 (1) and (2) 
23. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Cheating 318 (1) and (2) 
24. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Mischief (causing damage to property or loss up to 
Rs. 1000/-). 

324 (1) and (2) 

25. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  
 

Mischief by killing or maiming animal (value of 
up to Rs. 1000/-). 

325 

26. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Criminal trespass and house-trespass 329 
27. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  

 
Intentional insult with intent to provoke breach of 
peace. 

352 

28. Bhartiya Nyaya Sanhita,  2023  Misconduct in public by a drunken person 355 
29. The Vaccination Act, 1880  

(Act XIII of 1880) 
Punishment of offences covered by clauses (a), (b) 
and (d) of section 22. 

22 except clause ( c) 

 30. The Cattle Trespass  
Act, 1871 

Forcibly opposing the seizure of cattle or re-
securing the same. 

24 

31. The Cattle Trespass  Act, 1871 Causing damage to land or crops or public roads 
by pigs. 

26 

32. The Himachal Pradesh 
Juveniles (Prevention of  
Smoking)  Act, 1952. 

Penalty for selling tobacco to children 
 
 

3 

33. The Himachal Pradesh 
Juveniles (Prevention of  
Smoking)  Act, 1952. 

Seizure of tobacco from juveniles in a public 
place. 
 

4 

34. The Public Gambling Act, 
1867 (II of 1867). 

Penalty for owning or keeping or having charge of 
gambling house. 

3 

35. The Public Gambling Act, 
1867 (II of 1867). 

Penalty for being found in a gamblig house 
 

4 

36. The Public Gambling Act, 
1867 (II of 1867). 

Penalty on persons arrested for giving false names 
and address. 

7 

37. The Public Gambling Act, 
1867 (II of 1867). 

Offences under sections 22, 158 and 187 under 
this Act.”. 

 



  

 
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 
 The Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 requires amendments to align its 
provisions with recent legal and administrative developments. The enactment of the Bhartiya 
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023, the Bhartiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023, and the Bhartiya Sakshya 
Adhiniyam, 2023, has necessitated substitution of references to the repealed  Indian Penal Code, 
1860, Criminal Procedure Code, 1973 and the Indian Evidence Act, 1872. 
 
 The Bill further proposes to introduce electoral reforms on the analogy of the 
Representation of the People Act,1951, including provisions relating to electoral rolls, election 
expenses, qualifications, disqualifications and conduct of elections. It also aims to strengthen the 
functioning of Panchayats, by enhancing  penalties and jurisdictional values, rationalising financial 
procedures, and providing administrative clarity with respect to tenure, suspension, recovery of 
dues.  
 
 The proposed amendments are intended to ensure conformity with the new criminal laws, 
streamline electoral processes, improve institutional functioning, simplify procedures, and enhance 
accountability of office bearers. 
 
 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives. 
 
 

(ANIRUDH  SINGH) 
Minister-in-Charge. 

 
Shimla:  
The..................., 2025. 
 

___________ 
 

FINANCIAL  MEMORADNUM 
 

-Nil - 
 

____________ 
 
 

MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION 
 

-Nil- 
____________ 

 
 

THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  PANCHAYATI  RAJ  (AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2025 
 

A 

BILL 

 



 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (Act No. 4 of 1994). 
 
 
 

(ANIRUDH  SINGH) 
Minister-in-Charge.  

 
 

_______________ 
 
 
(SHARAD  KUMAR  LAGWAL) 
                      Pr. Secretary (Law). 
 
 
 
 
SHIMLA: 
 
The………., 2025. 
 
 

_____________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 


	izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu
	MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION


