Registered No. HSE/49. [Price : Rs.2-00 Paise

SO[PHPRE Trad(BS0
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE

PART IV-A EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BYAUTHORITY

No. 12] AMARAVATI, WEDNESDAY, 4™ MARCH, 2026.

ANDHRA PRADESH BILLS
ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

The following Bill was introduced in the Andhra Pradesh
Legislative Assembly on 4" March, 2026.

L. A. Bill No. 12 of 2026

A BILL FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH FIRE SERVICE
ACT, 1999.

Be it enacted by the Legislative of the State of Andhra Pradesh in the
Seventy-Seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) ThisActmay be called the Andhra Pradesh Fire Service (Amendment).
Act, 2026.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 1
December, 2025.

2. Inthe Andhra Pradesh Fire Service Act, 1999 (herein after referred to as
the Principal Act), in section 2,-

(i) forclause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

“(a) “Building” shall have the same meaning assigned to it in “the
Andhra Pradesh Building Rules, 2017” as amended from time to
time.”.

J-5/42 [1]

Short Title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 2.

Act No. 15 of 1999.



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

Central Act No. 30 of 1934.

Central Act No. 4 of 1884.

(ii)

(iii)

(iv)

(vi)

after clause (b), the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“(b-1) “Building Fire Safety Supervisor” means the person
appointed under section 21-A of Chapter-Ill by the owner or occupier
of certain premises and buildings as specified in this behalf to
ensure fire prevention and fire safety measures installed in such
premises and buildings;

(b-2): “Bye laws” means Fire Safety Regulations or Norms or
Guidelines made under National Building Code of India, the Andhra
Pradesh Building Rules, 2017, Oil Industry Safety Directorate
Guidelines, the Petroleum Act, 1934 and Rules, the Explosive Act,
1884 and Rules and International Standards relating to fire
prevention, or any relevant guidelines issued by the State

Government or local Authority as amended from time to time.”.
after clause (c), the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“(c-1): “Director of Fire Services” means an officer appointed to
assist the Director General in technical, administrative and other
departmental matters relating to the functioning and implementation
of fire services.”.

after clause (d), the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“(d-1) “Fire Prevention and Life Safety Measures” means such
measures as are necessary in accordance with the National
Building Code of India for the containment, control, and extinguishing
of fire and for ensuring the safety of life and property in case of fire

and as may be prescribed in the Rules made in this behalf.”.
for clause (h), the following shall be substituted, namely,—

“(h) “High-rise building” means a building as defined in the Andhra
Pradesh Building Rules, 2017 as amended from time to time
subject to the compliance of Fire Prevention and Life Safety
Measures”,

after clause (0), the following clause shall be inserted, namely,-



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

“(o-1) “Qualified agency” means a person or an association of persons
having technical specialization in the field of Fire/Civil/Mechanical
Engineering/ Technology, Industrial Safety, Disaster Management or
Chemical Science from a recognized University and having sufficient
domain knowledge and accomplishments in the field of Fire Safety”.

3. In the Principal Act, after the section 3, the following shall be added,  insertion of new

section 3-A.
namely,-
“3-A. In order to assist in any disaster, other than resulting due to fire, all
Fire Services shall be considered as Emergency Services.

Provided that, in case where the emergency service is not related
only to fire, the decisions and directions of the authority in charge of the

Member of Service shall prevail”.

4. Inthe Principal Act, after section 5, the following shall be added, namely,-  insertion of new

section 5-A.

“5-A. Powers, Duties and Functions of the Director General of State
Disaster Response and Fire Services : -

(@) The Director General of State Disaster Response and Fire Services
Department shall be subject to the superintendence and control of
the State Government, direct and regulate all matters of Fire safety
and Fire Prevention, Disaster Response, Firefighting and Rescue
equipment, Machinery and appliances, training, observation of
persons, events of mutual relations, distribution of duties, study of
laws, orders and modes of proceedings and all matters of executive
detail or the fulfillment of duties and maintenance of discipline of
members of Service and employees of the Andhra Pradesh State

Disaster Response and Fire Services Department under him.

(b)  Without prejudice to the provisions of clause (a) the Director General
of State Disaster Response and Fire Services Department shall

function as Head of the Department and shall,-

(i) frame the policies in relation to the development of State
Disaster Response and Fire Services and Fire Preventive
and Life Safety Measures and, on approval by the State



4 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

Government, take steps to implement the same.

prepare and submit plans and proposals to the State
Government with regard to the periodical review of fire and
rescue equipment, fire property and fire and rescue manpower
for effective functioning of Fire Services.

Substitution of 5. Inthe Principal Act, for section 13, the following shall be substituted,

section 13.

namely,-

“13. (1) Issue of Provisional Fire No Objection Certificate:- Any person

()

or entity proposing to construct a building mentioned below (as

classified in National Building Code of India) shall apply for a

Provisional Fire No Objection Certificate along with such fee as

may be prescribed:

(@)

(b)

()

All High rise Buildings as defined under clause (h) of section
2;

All Educational, Institutional, Assembly, Industrial and
Hazardous buildings;

Special buildings of Business, Mercantile, Storage,
Residential other than Apartment Buildings and Mixed
occupancies having floor built up area more than 500 square
meter on any one or more floors;

Buildings, having area more than 300 square meter of
incidental assembly occupancy on any floor;

Buildings of all occupancies with two basements or more, or

with one basement of area more than 500 square meter;

Special requests made by the Owner/ Occupier/Government
agencies of the Occupancies other than the above clauses
(a)to (e).

The Director General or any member of the service duly authorized

by Government in this behalf, shall within Twenty One (21) days of

receipt of such application, scrutiny by the members of service about



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

prescribed Fire Prevention and Life Safety measures as stipulated
in the National Building Code of India, as amended from time to
time or relevant National/ International Code of Practices, and
ensuring heights and setbacks as per Andhra Pradesh Building
Rules as amended from time to time shall issue a Provisional Fire
No Objection Certificate with such conditions as may be considered
necessary and if any shortfall, return the same for reasons to be

recorded in writing.

Issue of Fire Safety Certificate: After completion of construction
and ensuing of Fire safety installations in compliance with the
Provisional Fire No Objection Certificate issued under the
provisions of sub-section(l), the builder/occupier shall apply for Fire
Safety Certificate along with such fee as may be prescribed from
the Director General or any member of the service duly authorized
by Government on this behalf, shall within Thirty (30) days of
receipt of such application, scrutiny, inspection by the member of
service and issue Fire Safety Certificate.

Issue of Renewal of Fire Safety Certificate: - The Fire Safety
Certificate issued under sub-section (3) shall be renewed
periodically as notified by the government along with such fee as
may be prescribed from time to time.

The authority or officer competent to grant building permission prior
to construction and to issue a Building Occupancy Certificate after
construction, under the relevant law for the time being in force, shall
not accord such approval unless a Provisional Fire No Objection
Certificate issued under sub-section (2) and a Fire Safety
Certificate issued under sub-section (3), respectively, are produced,
wherever such certificates are required,

The Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
prescribe suitable Fire Prevention and Life Safety measures in
respect of buildings or parts thereof whose construction was



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

Omission of sections 6,

16, 17 & 18.

Substitution of 7.

section 19.

completed on or before the date on which this Act comes into force,
or which were under construction on that date.

Any person violating the conditions of Provisional Fire No Objection
Certificate and Fire Safety Certificate shall be liable to be

proceeded against under the provisions of this Act.

In the Principal Act, sections 16, 17 and 18, shall be omitted.

In the Principal Act, for section 19, the following shall be substituted,

namely,-

“19.(1) Without prejudice to the provisions of National Building Codes of

India, Building Bye-laws, any other law or Bye-Law, the owner or
the occupier, who are either individually or jointly responsible, of a
building as classified by regulations or part thereof, shall provide

fire prevention and life safety measures therein:
Provided that the owner or the occupier, as the case may be, shall,-

(i) provide minimum fire-fighting and life safety installations as
provided in section 2 (b2).

(i) maintain the fire prevention and life safety measures in
operational condition at all times, in accordance with section
2 (b2).

Notwithstanding anything contained in any law for the time being in
force, no authority empowered to issue the building occupancy
certificate, shall issue the same, unless it is satisfied that the owner
or the occupier, either individually or jointly, has complied with the

provision as given in sub- section (1),

No person other than the Qualified agencies, as specified in the
rule made under this Act, shall carry out the work of providing fire
prevention and life safety measures or performing such other related
fire protection activities required to be carried out in any place or
building or part thereof. In case the certificate submitted by a
qualified agency is found to be false / incorrect, the Director General
of State Disaster Response and Fire Services or the officer



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 7

authorized by him, shall take action to cancel their Certificate and
initiate criminal prosecution against the concerned as-per law in

force.
8. Inthe principal Act, after section 21, the following section shall be added,  Insertion of new
namely, section 21 - A,

“21-A. Appointment and Functions of Building Fire Safety Supervisor:

To ensure effective fire prevention and life safety measures for buildings
or premises and maintenance of Fire Prevention and Life safety
measures in the buildings or premises as may be specified by an order
by the Government in this behalf, every owner and occupier or occupiers
individually or jointly shall appoint a Building Fire Safety Supervisor,
having such qualifications as may be prescribed by the Government from

time to time.”.

9. In the Principal Act, for section 26, the following shall be substituted, Substitution of

section 26.
namely,-

“26. Penalty for violation of duty etc.,:

Notwithstanding any action which may be taken under the provisions of

this Act, any member of Service who,-

(1) isfound to be guilty of any violation of duty or willful breach of any
provision of this Act or any rule or order made there under; or

(2) isfound to be guilty of cowardice; or

(3) withdraws or abstains from the duties of his office without
permission or without having given previous notice for fifteen (15)

days or more; or

(4) Dbeing absent on leave fails without reasonable cause to report

himself for duty on expiration of such leave; or

(5) accepts any other employment or office or engages himself in
business in contravention of the provision of the Andhra Pradesh



ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

Amendment of 10.
section 27.
Amendment of 1.
section 28.
Amendment of 1 2.
section 29.
Amendment of 1 3.
section 31.
Insertion of new 14.

section 37 - A.

Substitution of 15.

certain expressions
by certain other
expressions.

Repeal and
savings.

Ordinance No. 9
of 2025.

16.

Civil Services (Conduct) Rules, 1964 shall be punishable with
imprisonment which may extend to three (3) months or with fine
which may extend to an amount not exceeding three (3) months
pay of such member, or with both”.

In the Principal Act, in section 27, for the words “five hundred” the words
“ten thousand” shall be substituted.

In the Principal Act, in section 28, for the words “five hundred” the words
“ten thousand” shall be substituted.

In the Principal Act, in section 29, for the words “five hundred” the words
“ten thousand” shall be substituted.

In the Principal Act, In section 31, in the proviso, for the words “one
hundred rupees per day” the words “one thousand rupees per day” shall
be substituted.

In the Principal Act, after section 37, the following shall be inserted,
namely,-

“37-A; Declaration of State Disaster Response and Fire Services as
Technical Service:

Without Prejudice to the provisions of any other law on the subject
for the time being in force, the State Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, declare the State Disaster Response and
Fire Services as Technical Services.”.

In the Principal Act, wherever the words “license/ license” occurs, the
words “Fire Safety Certificate” shall be substituted.

(1) TheAndhra Pradesh Fire Service (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025
is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or
taken under this Act.



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The existing Andhra Pradesh Fire Services Act, 1999 has been in force
for over 26 years. Over this period, significant changes have taken place in
the roles, responsibilities, and legitimate duties of fire service officials, both
operationally and administratively. Furthermore, due to rapid urbanisation and
the adoption of modern technologies, an amendment to the Act has become
essential.

Currently, the Act does not provide a provision for the issuance of fire
safety certificates. As per the MODEL BILL TO PROVIDE FOR
MAINTENANCE OF A FIRE & EMERGENCY SERVICE-2019 FOR THE
STATE” of Ministry of Home Affairs, Govt, of India fire safety certificates are
issued across the country in place of No Objection Certificates (NOC) or
licenses. To bring uniformity and alignment with national standards, the term
“fire safety certificate” is now proposed to replace the existing terminology
i.e., No Objection Certificates (NOC) or licenses.

The existing Act was based on the MODEL BILL TO PROVIDE FOR
MAINTENANCE OF A FIRE & EMERGENCY SERVICE-1958 FOR THE
STATE” of MHA, Gowt, of India, issued by the Government of India. However,
the Government of India has since issued a revised MODEL BILL TO
PROVIDE FOR MAINTENANCE OF A FIRE & EMERGENCY SERVICE-
2019 FOR THE STATE” of Ministry of Home Affairs, Government of India,
which recommends that states adopt legislation in line with the new model,
adjusted to their specific needs and circumstances. The Government of India
has been actively following up with States regarding the status of adoption,
with the aim of promoting reforms and providing assistance to States for
implementation.

The Andhra Pradesh continues to be recognized as one of India’s top-
performing States in Ease of Doing Business (EoDB). Currently, a new initiative
Speed of Doing Business (SoDB) is being promoted as part of ongoing
reforms. To align with this, the proposed amendment to the Act seeks to
streamline processes, ensure timely service delivery, and reduce ambiguity
through user- friendly provisions.



10

ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

The penalties prescribed under the existing Act are outdated and
nominal, remaining unchanged for over 25 years. Such leniency may lead to
non-compliance and undermine public safety. Considering inflation and rising
costs, there is a need to enhance penalties in line with the MODEL BILL TO
PROVIDE FOR MAINTENANCE OF A FIRE & EMERGENCY SERVICE-
2019 FOR THE STATE™ of MHA, Govt, of India to act as a deterrent and

ensure stricter compliance.

The definition of high-rise buildings varies between the National
Building Code (NBC) and local laws, leading to confusion between
departments. To eliminate this inconsistency, the definition provided in the
local municipal law will be adopted. Additionally, with rising land costs, urban
development is moving from horizontal to vertical structures. As such, there is
a need to redefine high-rise buildings and update associated safety
mechanisms to meet the demands of rapid urbanization and industrialization.

With the construction of high-rise and super high-rise buildings in the
capital city of Amaravati, modern and advanced firefighting technologies must
be implemented to ensure structural safety. The current Act focuses on
conventional firefighting methods, and an upgrade is necessary to
accommodate evolving technologies. Furthermore, the National Building Code
(NBC) 2005 has been revised to National Building Code (NBC) 2016, and
National Building Code (NBC) 2025 is currently under development to address
contemporary challenges in fire prevention and firefighting. Since building
and fire safety standards evolve approximately every ten years, it is necessary
to update the Act after 26 years to adopt these advanced measures.

And whereas, to ensure safety at all times and protect lives and property,
the appointment of a Fire Safety Supervisor is proposed, in accordance with
the Model Fire Force Bill. This role will ensure both maintenance and quality
control of fire safety installations, thereby reducing potential losses of life and
property.

In view of the above, it is essential to amend the Andhra Pradesh Fire
Service Act, 1999 to address the current conditions and evolving requirements
of the State.

Accordingly, the Government have decided to amend the Andhra



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

11

Pradesh Fire Services Act, 1999 suitably.

The Legislature of the State was not then in session and having been
prorogued and it has been decided to give effect to the above provisions
immediately, the Governor has promulgated the Andhra Pradesh Fire Service
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2025 on the 28" November, 2025 and the same
has been published in Telugu and English in Part IV-B, extraordinary of the
Andhra Pradesh Gazette, dated 1t December, 2025 (Andhra Pradesh
Ordinance No.9 of 2026).

The Bill seeks to replace the said Ordinance and to give effect to the
above decision.

ANITHA VANGALAPUDI
MINISTER FOR HOME AFFAIRS AND DISASTER MANAGEMENT






4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

13

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clauses 2 (iv). 5 (1), (3), (4), (6), 7 (3), 8 and 14 of the Bill authorizes the

Government to issue notification in respect of the matters specified therein

and generally to carry out the purposes of the Act,

All such the notifications issued, which is intended to cover matters
mostly of procedural in nature is to be laid on the table of the both Houses of
the State Legislature and will be subject to any modifications made by the
Legislature.

The above provision of the Bill regarding delegated legislation are thus
of normal type and mainly intended to cover matters of procedure.

ANITHA VANGALAPUDI
MINISTER FOR HOME AFFAIRS AND DISASTER MANAGEMENT






4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

15

MEMORANDUM UNDER RULE 95 OF THE RULES OF PROCEDURE
AND CONDUCT OF BUSINESS IN THE ANDHRA PRADESH
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY.

The Andhra Pradesh Fire Service (Amendment) Bill, 2026, after it is
passed by the Legislature of the State may be submitted to the Governor for
his assent under Article 200 of the Constitution of India,

ANITHA VANGALAPUDI
MINISTER FOR HOME AFFAIRS AND DISASTER MANAGEMENT

PRASANNA KUMAR SURYADEVARA
Secretary-General to Legislature.






SOFDBS ee0
BOFBBS PHDHOE
B8 8o 03 WOPHBE PODOESS
2026, £79 B0, 45 BHD HIIPYPEDHD.

2026650 1285 PDODHOES ey

wo(EES wiErsE her S, 199065 uolir $500WHEES Dy,
qrsi [HerTregl B8 D65 HoSEind® wofiSds og edshotin
& (B0l DESore Hnsn Dhss:-

L (1) & Sguiod solfiEtd eiirss Lo (H6te) g, 2026
wi) DS,
(2) wf 2025, Ahonth 1508 stbend D8 St srdotatl S8,

2, woPSds wfpedd Do g, 1909 (soth wee Dyt EeE
Hegson eSS 25 SoTHE5e’, -

@

(i)

(il

oz ()b otheore, & (Bod oD aoddBih, edssm, -

W) YgisEsin” wEr eoke Shabdineoth $58ospls Do
sof|SET sk Aoy Jobirer, 20176° Rl adrnds ol
wtpin H0R actdsi.”

wotin (0) shard, & (3ol oDl FlpoIsok, wddhm, -
HB-1) s Py B s BrEERnE” wim Y |Srofmre
b e abasrd Soe Darbibid ed [Srotiere Sibok
gitmred® Domin SdbollS wiyites Dertics $o8din iy SEmy

Hioee Sl SDoSeRE eoydhio- 1185 21-D S6Tk
Bod Ddbivodadd S el wihn

(D-2) “Beorf” wire il arbok 455 Domps Hobrl, wogndl
&5 Do Dabivine, 2017, St 0D gigee Zogts
Srdsderen, DS Odbo S$4En, 1934 Hddh Dubdines,
DA S, 1884 Hbdks Aobidnes Hoah efgiamed
Berdenth HomofioD eotobod gibrere Bor wae Sbohinect
mm@@ﬁ@m%&ﬁﬁmﬁ:ﬁwm
Sowofd 03N Srfdgee \Bol SoirGlcbeld ensdrs
g8 Dmoiiter Bor Hlrmre Soe Srgifsen @) efibn.”,
potizn (B) Sthard & |Bob orlD Fhnodsih, edssm,-

“R-11 “efFErds whe FOEH" oir ofirdE Rde e
Sobdin wibenth Hopofols Jolss, SEdurr Hbdin wpth
Soeofolld ast Dhdirod® FEEN aaidh Sdbo dabomDE

DeiiboSnds efEd Bl wliie.”.
[17]

Hoyidraiin
ot |FRtiogiin,

T
Hathen.
190945 155

g

193485 303
ol g,
1684650 42 Bolls
o,



18

ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

3- i BE

Bi—al @3l B°8

(v} wotiin (&) Sthard & (Bob DD Flyodst, ednsm,-
HE-1) "efSEes Daetie Bk (@ B §lE S e
sfydies 067, Idbo|fe Hbdn Joinbl otd eddd
45 Mo Rolrdil HEHBOBED eidDE Lo ot
ool Hh Dabiired' JhrESSieds Dborm efySsrso
Hogolpt (e S g10E o ehB i Shobid
igen &) @lism.”,

) wotidn (Frik aterr & Bob DO 4odsBih, eBtbm, -
(Erd) OGN gdbo” i efided Jede DHd (e
B giter dets ol wd Shabiivecth SSBosnds
ma@;ﬁémwm, EDITHW
o Sl o wliso.”,

(V) ot (o) Shars 6 (Bod polidnid Tiyoldt, edtkkm,-
“a=1) "wiEite DB ol 50l ol DHRDmmdHND
dool sRErlERISelEd aondbof/Aroiay Degesbain,
FOFE HES, DhE Adee S dabiey Soined®
AroBBE (FdES SORGY H0ch oiErsE $gd dofodt
éhdod HEdb H0epio Hbaky Fheastveh SDAGH K8 Sor
o Sindein oD wgin.”.

3. (@ SigEnd D 35 SEFEE S5HTE & Bob mRD DB,
Wi, -
“B-2. wiyHirtio TEnalr togfodt mkomr, H8H INae’ S¥aho
I% o)) ofpirsd hled s&R5E Dl aidodolsBib,
©ond, BdSis B eAEre0s SrEd SoocfolSh SSkawd,
[FFReed Bog @l aferd Har SR Dfdire S0 et uioad®
aotSHB.".
4. @HEd SgEd'D B Hodin SHTrd S (Sob D) DEE,
SESe, -
62 TR DS B8R0 Hddky efiriE o FOEE esid
) eferoren, Hben SHddko Hydsoen: -



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

19

(2) Trg DB& BBosS Hbdhn efyErss Do ey ZBED =858,
T (40 H6iEgm Bbdk dboBn ol solisbih. enmsE ggE
2bdn off Sdrore dorbe o) of) JNdieorh, D88 B850,
wi@ard Jare Hbdo Gis DOHDen, dholErer b AdESme,
B, Sphe S58ded, SEHE Yomorre Hofobden, Dibe Hobd, Seye
©ijubiHs, (Erhiorbe el HBdH Hijiben HBdh SENTRS Dboe
Tootfy ety Difcirven wo|HBAE o DN EEFDOE Dol eREE Rde
Tp 85 whitod® &) hor Behen Hbah affybe dng Mo Dpe
Sbak Eidgnd Mhirobbh edidohd Hoah VdhoBohin,

(@) podsdn () o) JwoFHH ¢oro Beufidhons org DBy
HBEods Hodh eiFrdd o ey FBES wddd erhsdmr
HEPEOSSBD, HEd,~

0 oof D58 PEBG00D Hbdk ofipiesl Dl DBk efyHies
Rerde Sbodb e Ofe dder Sfe offa8 Sonofod
SFarei trirobodiaih Hbdk ooy Hdbe; wirdin dhard
TE) sholdbd SHed ShERes,

i) ehSess Do PerEtedsd 0 S efErsE H0dk
Ue B8R, sAEESE el DHbdk efsrss Hoa S
Reodd JabsmDE S Somofod ooy HeherDE (Serhte
0cin ([FaSrElei Bdridd $H80dND.

5. (HErs Siod®D) 135 HOTEEnD nibeorr & (Bob oD dodsss,
WO, -

“13.(1) eremll sfirns 525ods (HSSES0 b 1~ |Bo
LEyEals @itind Mobes Hadecl 2580 HE Sor Hog (Pl
B 455 Doys Bolrse® HLEBODS DESuE) LEEIGTGEE o
SerBiirtn erenDs efySrdd DEeEoEs HddEtn BUD Sord Saban:

(@) 238 DoY) poin (2r5) Boll MDD Diisure of IBH

eSS mes; 2
(@) o) Dery, Sois, (Serdsnurdiren, SBiEPIDE SHoak s
Esiitwen;

(&) @mm%mmﬁa@m&ua‘ 500 &etsy Snta
S0l J Does DR o ergTot Bimren H8k DiFD
RarRren S arird, ardey, Doy, Dariin SO (58 dbwen;

155 $0dyant

dodbi,



20

ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

@) 280 wosiygp B00 3665 ot ol ks DB’ wibwad
|SerRainards St

(m) Dot Bor wodhivod HS@oty for 500 $585 Hoy Lol
DS DR BOAS o¥ HRTotl S0NS wdy T s

(@) (D) ol (m) J6H Ko golsine &9 srlomr Jordre
dbadirlRobiddiHend bale ot [ b,

(2) FOEE eS0d Bor & Ddchind® dSomohold (Hebdnds
@reetnabanls IS0 Do S, wf Stes e08s v ey (21)
Fere e soie Sildbined® 350005 DEore oros erdioh 4455 Sogs
Bolrdd’ TGBoLH Diorr DIPESEIAS sREFNrE Darts SH6d (e
Ugm gider St oD Toe Homohd erddbjwosTdch Holrss'D
el bdn edr Shdbiveocd 350005 Mor wolsss 55
Do Dobire @Eeto e fHbdkn B wyloi HESGEn b Siged
$04000 SIHEHN PRoSHDY AoHhos® TagDE eMEFSE VoSS
hsd|gsnd idchsts Db HED Fisnihond snsve
gt Bevty 3 oDl 358 Hossa.

(3) wipErst gdor Ghssighn b Doyminit GpoSh Hbak
ail-0%yEn (1) dog) Mwofide Bcd wbddbalds oydd ehbesy
VBgHoBY FhiHEhe POn ehErsE Yoee [Baptte TN sk,
P oS Rarhibth, FOES eiitd Sor & DE0bEES Honofod [Hebikin
38 |PoerEindbads 00 har 5450 Sol DLESESaGhEY of best
wipErss e HEG|Sse i Sy Tobih. uf el wobid
dly (30) Peresly Do iy 568000, S2DIH Hoah e
e HSnEsndh mbdchaa.

(4) ®iyiroE fdee Hiitgdn (obEn b ad-5og)Eam (3)
Boti =rb Tabmdd wipirss s HES5n e SHhdhineotd
DIFSSET0HNE of Ded' S Bebdvind efirdotnds Do Db
Fusind® SDEbodntaDh,

(5) Royedd dSwoh FI Jouw BN Hodn [HhEno
wend®ig) Honcdd euSssn Bod Ao DS Shard diSs s
Eheisigdnid eraod ey Soy Bor Big ©fses, &8-S50k (2)



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 21

Both erdtionalis evemDt eyl Do EEiEsn ik o DT
(3) (ot erb Schadd efiEedd Hder LosHEsDH @5‘5553335155-9.: o
osd@inod St S8odst ) of elrtind Bobo.

(6) & Shsim ehod™DE 3O 30 88 o wods ageREm,
Roresdin pdond Bor of 86 TH2 Joymsn abrb&d gssoan S
TS grritmet SAK ofiyfodd DEREE Dbk (S S5 Shpd (HebdEn
wHSEE AESS" wfEmSS ouor DIPEIEESSD.

(7)) eremDs whyimss DEoss Ehisn SHodk shyirE s
(Ehstis To Esthet anolrodi D HAMSM & Stk St Ductide
Bods Shgen BRETHnS HMBHELD,

B. BErS oo™ 16, 17 Hbain 18 S6dyitnet S603HESH. 16, 17 fod

182 Bodyisneds
SEBEdim.
7. (55 Shiod®D 195 HOFES0dn nihenrr & Bol TN GosiB, 104 s6dsk
wISSmE,— Aol

“19.(1) 88 B g55% Doy dolrdes, G558 Doses Bl OE0
=dt dgzio S Pertd golo Borifion, Iwofider Sor wothd®d grifo
e S0ECoEnlS FSisnh abaxird Bur avd Sfirtorr Boe Hodigore
artjyd S2rod eothd® efSird darts Hodh e s @er ok
BDnoddaD, ",
sond, ahasrd o Sotvyhirto DorheD,-
0 2 (02) 56TEEnd® Locodd DFore B efiyhens HBdn
e S PSer SBEruD Domts Db,

) 2 (22) 56Fym (Ferbo, el Hhdbiioed® hyStns Date
sbdin ffer Stigod S0TL §8S° D s P Ste
APt B,

(2) Sdpbobins odend® aif) HTN 88 TS0 D adH80
(Erfeed Soif 53 IS Ehdte Sigo @b SabeeRs |PPescshiabom
ad-H0tHn (1)6° s dnoyid chedrd Bor Dad Hirdorr =R
B Socingore omesh KodhTodsd Sy, €50 s whdEse dgo
el Wobads,



22

ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

21-2) wils B
S8yt
SrEnoing,

263 BOTSSmD

e,

(3) & dgiin Bod Srdrofols Nobibind® BEY eEsLONS
@iy, ) © B8, g Boo g dSdo For 0D erriod®
wfyddrd forte Dbdo e e e dfed eobodic S
Firfoddobl wiiting of) (el Sooohodd srtgEeorarai
RGEPOHNE SN TS, vf I¢ gl S0AS D8 5By eDS KhdKss
Bfo dpdjeEhin el ShFlNgond ooy Do [B8HesS Hbdk
oi)Eess Do F0EG adter Sor 0803 whsto Pobd ©Hw, b
) (oSstes HEoD teh T BB wibend® 6 Sh¥w Hedo tonchd
Sged Jord@ritnd b b Do,

B. Ferd ShEnd®D 218 SO0HBHn dhard & |Bob BETEH0dH
ST, wDEHP,-

“21-2. o Ond efyddrs fier Yrbael ot Hbdh
Eydannen:
gisidzimen B (rorerod® S8EHS wfyShrs Dot S Sbdk
moth Bod) Hebde 8T Gty oo WEY Mo FETe Soe
@rofimrod® iy Nede SHba (et diier SGemh Tamns
B8 dhessird ok Jabid S darbées Sinsorr Jor Hodiodonr
eolr Sibdbinooth [Hh#d MrESE08 Dorr of e 50A e
P55 efyBsrs der wrdbpebh Jdbinodset.
9. (Sl Shrims’D 265 BOTSENSD wthenre & (Bol DD SodSED,
WE e, -

"26. Dihen ToBPID SBEDCIToHS el

& SeE0d'D Jpolite [Peeto BaEabhisd dED 958 tomoio
Shomr J580 Do i iat

(1) & Sigdiod® 28D Doots Sor ool (Bod tefroBodels 280
Adhsdn o adHS% wfirtigonr noduodiotht: Sor Deiuih
agodiodadd e SRFRdgons; dor

(2) Ho88kos® &'yr EDMNNGond: Bor
(8) wibds Sbore Bur BOIFw(15) Beven Sor @odtol] a5

Swodid Sieorto sighotr srpdd Jihe ol IPFSEo Tor ftsFa
sesio; do



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

23

(4) Roud® sol, ©f Dol ARG dhard, SirdERs sdno
o #Hd b 0§ AR et sbone Atbifahe® aduip;
Glag

(5) eoEEs HDE HERT (B5G) DcbibSnen, 196465 Doodith
Dbgore DD BBt 6FEn Bor Hi5D Bor el mydod® Debifpbmitiond
o SR8 Horth(3) Joo S PahoSed s 8 Bor foeth(8) Jue
FERd Zoowd Zwerdd Jidoded mbdra Ho Bodol&tsr
BBodotssi. .

10, B Sisnd®D 275 s6THtidnd® “nib Sotw” e HEEved
othen “HHTen” sl $Bfvedh doldBih.

11 (Bered Staxind®D 288 SeTind” "o Soder” e Do
obenr “SoTen” wib SEi00D GoUSED.

12, @erd doiod ™ 205 SOFEE® ‘oth Holfes” i StXvod
DebenrF “HHIen” e SEfnoh aoSST5%.

18, @Hems ShEnd™D 318 S6FHESSD dranvops® B S
tedediben” ol Sikned aberr “Serth Son Grdrdbe” B SBiwe
BoSEBb.

14, (@Bers S4End®D 375 D0FE50 SHE, & Eob wrad FHousa,
wBESTE, -

“37-2. oy DB BOOSN Do enEeed Do FoBoy
e (@HEdoso ;

Bso wibend® &) & vodop AT B8 HEENS®D Daolite
goto Senihors, ooy (4bieo, abels 255" wbifimds T
T DO (BB Dby efEirdd Dhoh FoB8E D
[SEdodstn@. "
16. [Hgri dtgiind™ “BRSERG)" eib Sddwen 5 S50 ‘e
S (HoBaSHn" b Sudvet dosssk.
16. (1) eo@iSaE efysrss Dar(ist) egrdiin, 2025 sothireimn:
Bt Sabelsa
(2) wf 558 Somofo Bbowe, Bt werBdhie Bod Bbs dor
rotbry 280 St & Sy Bot DY Bor ESHNAr PrhoSnlsBi,

274 a*:ﬂé-y:’:::m‘rﬁ!:
S,

D8 aaazﬁm;sm
st

203 STyt

R,

315 50
Shaiides.

37-0 wits B
sy
Syt

2388 HBoBHneos
ahenre §°Q)
D@08
€0

L’-fy s
SodFomoaien,
202645 08
R e






4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

25

ﬁw - SEFen

Erpdiin i) wolFHEE efEi-nE Do Sin, 1999, 26 Hosdoos
BIT ofeod® aifd. (EDS & Sosns” eipess ke shsbe dug
SFien, argden Hldko Tychedin Dhod DigFmdddionr @Hoak
SoTrOTPSEINT BoloBatiis Bonghis Srthm S $5855%0 =8R8,
sodshonr, digp Hidite Hed eHlE sl drron slecdostsn
Do, SLpD8 St eeiEREe,

B gien 50850 Higre O8RSy Psin Shtnd® Duotks
SR)oB. 8 [y eosonE o o@isyry Tl Ty e
0B IS Hi5-2019 A B Dompn Babols Sskre Doy (e,
PSEEOEYS (DSt Heren (QRE8) Tor BRRe Adiind” Bmpiiorm efpmss
e (ot SEren @b Dabatmon, erdah [Firoras® DEGrGEE SHbn
$ETpa l SHBTSmRE, (SRt Berein ol DEgOSS (HHEds
SEren (QF4D) Bor PGl oo “efirss ddor Hhdke HEde™s
Gomrol) Hhesn [HHFEoSELe.

dsinig Jiin, rod (B5bdiod ebSchads o8 (H40s,
uodbohs fbiffore Doy Tof) oof eSS BHodh ©EEss
Hi5-1958 DG Edn Sones Sabols St Dayd erosd e,
wond, oeid [Sgbdin, gridd (Bgbdy wodtions HFore doolBdcery
oo, Trg FSeSE oBdin &S HH-2019 D Bde Dovw
dabels 550008 Shrmr Dad 0TS0, 0b 5 Siro ebibotomr
t"l._%“-” & Sty sdooflod, T ﬂné&ﬁ%ﬁ@-ﬂ eiRioren Sobdin HORETE
Sgertn Foe'oron hir) 650, el el SSerY) el
$baby Sofimes Ddirod aBdins® hts HB& Somofol o
Sebiiin orpes® Bairdotor SoliBode mthidna.

Doodfdd aydrd Aled® (aadd) gridddod® wdyitom
REEr) TiEped® wolliSiE 8 HRotnthig. Skt BNIHiG
Soffmed” griitnm JBodDHS oyartid (25.480) B8 St
[BaBrostdnn. &08° $5typs®0s SHordmid, (HBdbi Eomgo
Dobrell, Ssreiing’ Hiew wolodo Db MITFHTFHOS BiEreT
ReoliiSe TRDP SoRHSh Ehoilitio, & SERE HEFEOIN Wite AZEDEA.




26

ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [PART IV-A

rpdEng o Bol DrEssdads b oo S5O HBak
e @I eol 26 Hosdreh R St Bhone e, o dodd
e gD JrSouENto Mbdk NgEkeds wabion Hehesto
sbbcin EMDERY Pouth S0MeEE*Il Bhtotr, Darbodnsa8 Hbdko
s8iore ardod Do JdboeDE grds BH4bd; wodboll HiEdtoe
SoddiTy Tnd Ty ofEirsd bk gttt B -2019 Htgre S
sontn Jdbold Shrer Dok sdhesinr drdos boSSeds
erziididaoo b,

Q8D Fidtoe dof AShin B E55 Joym Holrd (25OD)
Eobdin S8 Shpe Sy o aoll, Tpe @i KoddR w08 obiign.
8 SOHT JheyRy Folodteld N8 el Stped® SPomhiHtys
A edeclodtihdod. wddorr, el 8o LEALS0 T4,

D@ Qrod fpow ol 28 kot mﬁ:ﬂdﬂﬂéﬁﬁmgmmﬁa
SpFdsDomrins eddte ach. Hedh Db a’iédzﬁ-éﬁm SoBciin
FoEidtn osired 85008 Sirtoncs 88 dhogomem
ShAEboSSeh &8,

TP Aldse wshmshs® OB Sobatn edes I5S 458 oprod®
Nomeedd G585S S0l wHdE Seak m%%}&r Dol whipsms
Sfms roBBESed dihors eien Jaird. [Hhd Sudw FoBordd
SfSErE Om Sfdop oS85 bk Acitddes w0 BlyoioeRE
o) DodSohd enttingh. eclrbor eddh s Do Bolrd
(25E8) 20052, erdab 455 Dovgm Sobrd (ATOH) 2016 HHBoHLTH
EpBdin efyfrsd [Hdarmred Jarbohe bk efySirs dks b
e SeBoSmS arch 455 Doye Kol (D5D%) 2026:5 Sihdss
wlid ST, §5i5 Hodh efyEirs giter Dirar Gdudod GiED
56 Hodfioren wanibohs, & e dabeds dhus esoolodmit, 26
Roldve Bhard Sipt eerdtddobs et agh.

ef) Sdired® 58 SO oUoRs Hid (e Hidn ehom
GRobn efjirds vore SMrae Db eibrbaiinr effErsl 5ed
Aedb3el Dairtberl] |S0rBoSERNE. adkh efEess giss ke
T DD DHbdy ragd Dobolds Dolod Binod Dgorr ddabei
drrye Sogilod (S S0k o) Siped Shhe.



4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

27

D DBBde thaps, ovie Mok (Shd S0DEen DB e ksdy
eStorel; S0500Se0E eoFBEd wnSrds Do Show, 19995

SO @Skt aha.

BEEDFET, BhdEn eoPEtd efirs e S, 19995
Sro08rr HSBONSTEY Dcnolit,

o) TolD SR Sabel Hbdh Sirdiing® Bhoths ok
B Dmodied S5 eibo ddeed Hfanod, HEk 2025, SScal 285
B wolgEtd eipeds Dap (Site) errfdsn, 20260 wb Sert b
=k (20266°0 95 wolHEE wgr@vin) 2025, &dont 15 388 eoBEds
NEE dng) edrgide, oo V-0 Sod Berk HBcH wofsne
[SeoBodalse,

& Dey H5S A |3 e TN
, T %Wawmm

sofedrd eld,
o Sbato

D50 W T ol






4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY

29

(58 i Sogninih K80 Jita

ﬂ{gﬁ"‘;} potdoes 2(v), B{1),(8),(4)(6), 7(3), 8 Hbc lded®
NgistSeds Dhdreh Sonofol efErSS b Dubbd Hoak
FrErSonre Sk Haredtined R BeHExints SotnlEn.

e Dijiore end DobelHl efimite ToStS BHBARSERS Jhdirab
e 005D. T80 g THNiolD agcd Wibive BN nolEEh
¥obain e eidiold dakm S5 Spds P dothib,

B, 558 w0 oemedinid 108005 Dend® B Deogd Aerbnink
0B Herdore [HBAEEES Didhine PED dFlotnlin.

wohogd enus,
o Hbam

DSde ki Ty Hod.






4" MARCH, 2026] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 31

SOEORE TENSE o (BB bk AEre ALErSTE
955 DuhEm (Botl DSYes.

wolFHEE wiErts Do ({$50m) dey, 20260 T FHESHOED
STRHON Bty gRUE SoDEFERD 2008 wioFsEn o b gy
RS SEbyossas.

Sotiolrd o,
o Sobdin

el DSEFn T o8,

(BDK) S5rE ‘@523356
BT SUEE), TS SR,

Printed by the Commissioner of Printing at A.P. Legislative Assembly Printing Press, Amaravati.



